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As we celebrate twenty years of NABBA
contests, lhe cenlralfocus of lhis issue
is. of course. the rccenl competition
hosted in Cincinnat iand I 'd l ike lo pub-
licly express my gralitude to those of
you who generously reviewed the va -
ous aspecls of the compelilion while I
was stuck in the box." Having had lhe
pleasure now of playing, conducling (and
winningl) ,  helpingto host,  andadjudicat-
ing at NABBA contests, il's mosl grali-

t ing lo experience the high level of
intogrity and witness lhe extraordinary
level of detail and care and organization
lhat goes into any ot our competilions.

Wthin this issue you can read in delail
on the various events that took place in
Cincinnal i .  Both the Erass Band of
Columblrs and the lllinois Brass Band
made history, with ihefirsl time thattwo
bands have tied for first place. In addi-
t ion, lhe 8BC won fora record ninth l ime,
and the IBB became the f i rst  band lo
record a double hatrick of consecutive
wins. Congratulations to both bandsfor
magnificent accornplishments

As well as extensive articles on pro-
grams and band news, Tom l\ryers as-
sesses the percussion sections in Cin-
cinnati, Ron Holz continues his slerling
work wilh both recording reviews and
music rcviews from this yea/s Reading
Band, David Buckley keeps us in touch
witheventsin Canada, and l 've included
a l is l ing of olr  compett ive winners at
NABBA for the past tweniy years.

Happy reading and besl wishes faryour
upcoming brass band activities.
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Well now that lhe dLrst has seltled on
NABBA Competi t ion XX rt 's lhat i ime to
thank those many people that made i t
happen, and also reflecl on the posilives
and howwe can keep improving.

You responded overwhelmingly with
thanks and praiseto both The Cincinnat i
Brass Bandandthe NABBAstaff. Thanks
foryour suggest ions for the future; they
wil be reviewed and discussed at the
next NABBA board meel ing

I!4y lhanks, especial iy goes to Dwight
Wages President of The Cincln nati Erass
Band and head ofthe competi t ion steer-
Ing committee, for his tireless effods in
putt  ng an except ional ly wej l  run week
end together Thanks, also to the rest
of The Cinc nnat i  Brass Eand steer ng
commit lee. members of lhe band and

lhe manY volunteers

And enough cannot be said about the
NABBAteams. ContestControl ler,  John
de Salme did a magri f lcent job in orga-
n zing, prel iminary work and keeping a
watchful eye over lhe entire week end
Ron Holz Associale Conkoler,  brought
his years of experlise and knowledge
which we were gratefulfor.

To lhe rest of  lhe teams; Frank and Sara
Norih, Lo u is (Hap) Bou 19ois, Tom IVyers.
JoelPugh, a nd J eff  Clyme r---you ranthe
competition lke a wejl-oiled rnachine

The Lexinglon Brass Band and Vincent
d lMart ino was cerlainly a highlghi on
Fridayn ght playingtooneof thelargest
and enthusiaslic crowds ever

And, enough cannot be said about the
Gala Concert's perfomrance by The Brass
BandOf Bat i leCreek. l fyouwerethere.
you knowwhat I  meanl l l

I t  was wonderfulseeing al lofyou. \ruhat
a great camaraderie we have in brass
banding. Congratulat ions to al l  of  the
bands, ensembles, and soloists who
made i l  a specialweek end.

The next NABBA competition wli be
exceptional and a first--we head farther
soulh lo Little Rock, and they are prepar-
ing now, fofus lo have a greatweek end

Thankyou for a great NABBA XX.
Ani la Cocker Hunt
NABBA Presideni

Doyen Recordings and Sa vaiionisl Pub,
ishing & Suppl ies Ltd wi l l jo in forces in
a unique padnershlp in the d si f  ibut ion of
brass band recordings ihroughout ihe
world. SP&S wi I become proprietofs of
the entre Doyen catalogue and wi l lbe
the pr incipal distrbutors of al  Doyen
l i l les DoyenRecord ngswil lcont inuein
the r quesl to bnng qual l ty record ngs of
ihevery bestbrass ensembles n Europe
into lhatcata ogue Given the receni re-
emergence of the Egon label togelher
wiih the development of its own SP&S
label,  this parlnersh p wi l l  make SP&S
arguably lhe largest dis ir ibuior of  brass
band recordings in the world.

Congratu ations to the Brass Band of
Columbus (Pau Droste)who wi I  repre-
sent NABBA af ier being selecied io
peform atthis yeais Midwest Band and

Orcheska Cl in c in December 2002.

The Brass Band of C€ntral  Flor ida
stands ready to begin an exci i ing and
eventfu 2002-20 03 seaso n. Fo lowing a
skong showng al  lh is year 's annua
NABBA compett ion, the BBCF has a
ful  s aie ofactvi l ies planned, Lncluding
performances al St James Calhedra
and Lake Eola Park in downlown OF
lando. Alsoinlheplannrngstagefor lhs
fall is a concerl fealuring euphoniunl
virluousoStephen ltlead. BBCFiS sched-
! led to cul  i ts fLrst  CD lh s yearto include
plenty ofpopularbrass band favori tes as
we las a few mofe ser ious pieces forthe
e n i h u s r a s l s  i n  l h e i r  a u d i e n c e
www. b r a s s b a ndofce ntr alfloida o rg

Membe6 of the Lou svr l le P pe Band
skl l led along on three p eces rn a sur-

prise endingtoa Commonwealth Brass
Band (Jerome Arnend) performance on
Apri l7,2002 at Indiana Universi ty South-
easi,  NewAlbany thatmghl have been
caled'Fourpipers p p ng;onedrummer
drumming. '  Two nights before lhe con-
ced, a mini-band ofCommonweal ih vol-
unteers had p ayed ai appearances by
lhe P pe Band si ! l lcomplemenl ofbag-
pipers and drummers pedorm ng to-
gether lhe Rose ofKelvingrove (Knox),
Skye Baal Song ard Highland Cradle
Sorg(arr. Lamb) and Scotland the Brave
(Trad/parts for brass band revsed by
Amend) CBB also was visi ted by two
outstandLng cl inic ians. The f i rst ,  on Feb.
13, was Torgny Hanson, conductor of
the internationally renowned Siockholm

cantinued on Page 7
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lJnder the capable direction of Brian
Burditt. Bandmaster of the Salvation
Army Canadian Staff Band, The
Hannaford Band presenled a most en-
joyable conced featuring David Daws,
P.incipal Cornet of the Enfield Salvation
Army Band and just retired principal of
the International Staff Band onAoril2S.
2002 in Toronlo. Ontario.

David Daws opening solo, Go/de, Srp-
p6ls (Bearcrofl), wasflawlessly and er-
cilingly executed, convincing the audi-
ence lhal Dawg ranks with the finest
cornet players anywhere- All the charac-
teristic Bearcrofl touches in the accofi-
panimenl were fully realized buiwithout
al any time covering lhe soloisl. This
solo was wrilt€n tor D6rryck Diffey who
was in lhe audiance enthusiastically
supporting the soloist. Daws showed us
his f lowing lyrical sound in Martin
Cordnet'sarangementof Paul Marchall's
Mid All Tha Tnffic, although with a bit
morc vibrato lhan lwoold have liked. ln
lhe second half, Daws play€d Erik
Leidzen's yyord,,ous Day, wrilt€n for
DerekSmith. Fatherof Phil Smith Daws
favou ted  us  w i th  a  fun  enco re
(unannounced) and as a further encore,
the comet trio, Bugler's Holiday, wilh

Hannaford players, Ray Tizzard and
Sluart Laughton. This may have been
the fastest Bugl6/s I have heard. Nor-
mally you would not think of speed as
being a prime nusical charactedstic,
bul itwas greal fun nervertheless.

In the first halfofthe program, the band,
afler opening with Mlleslore (Himes),
played Rocky Mounlain Ovedu,e (Bu rge),
Romanco (Kulesha)--a brass kanscrip-
tion of his string work-and New Wotid
Dances (Ellerby). Allthree pieces were
interesting and ref r6shingly accessible,
usetul additions lo any band's €pertoire
lparticr.ilarly entoyed the Kulesha which
paid homage lo olherfine string compo-
silions which had been an influence on
Gary in his youlh.

The second halfopened wilh Hannafod
SIrceI March (Ballatine) played in lrue
light and brighl Eallantin€ style. This
was followed by Flourish and Dances
(Norbury), a shortfour movemontwork of
greatcharm. Theconcludingit6mtolhe
program was Leslie Condon's brilliant
selection, 7he Call of ThE Righleous.
Burdill and lhe band gavean absolulely
scinlillating performance of ihis classic,
marred only by the tiniest of slips from

the cornels in the opening tanfare. This
opening fanfare is a challenge lo any
cornet seclion and several of the top
bench cometplayersf rom the Tottenham
Citadel, nowEnfield, bandwhopremiered
this wolk in the late 1950s talked afteF
wards aboul shillings being pul on the
stand to go lo the playerwho was flaw-
less. The rest ol the performance was
outstanding with a spine tingling finale.
This piece should be heard more frcm
NABBA bands and would mak€ an ex-
cellenl own choice in contests.

Despite some criticism of aspects of lhis
band's pertormance, I am continually
amazed by their ability to perfonn such
d€manding repertoire with such limiled
reheaasal and with so many gu€sl con-
duclors. In lhis concert, Bandmaster
Burditt managed to coax the Hannaford
players inlo some double pianos andlhe
lromboneseclion inlo making mofeotan
impact in the ensemble, both significant
improvements. Only an over enlhusias-
tic tuba in ihe opening fiarch and some
louchy tuning from muted horns and
baritones marredwhatwas an outstand-
ing performance. The Hannaford Band is
lo congratulated fortheircontinued con-
lributions lo ihe Canadian brass band
scene. Well done Hannafordl

David Buckley.

MARKYOUR DIARIES!!

NABBAXXI
Apri l  1' l -12, 2003

Little Rock AR
Hosted by Solid Brass

Gala Concert bythe

Grimethorpe Colliery Band

NABBAXXII
Aoril 16-17. 2004

St Louis MO
Hosted by the St Louis Brass Band

ln collaboration with a

Gala International
Brass Band Festival
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continued fran page 5

Soulh Ci ladel Eand and ihe Nat iona
Youlh Wind Orchestra of Greai Br tain
and Inspeclor of lM l ary [,lusic in Swe-
den He worked successfully wilh Com-
monweallh on Concertante for Band
(Bulla) and The Three f/luskeleerc
(Hespe) which CBB periormed at April s
C ncinnati NABBA competilion. The sec-
ond cl inic ian to work with lhe band, on
Aprl  17, was Frank Renton the noted
Engl sh conduciorwhowas on hol iday in
Kentucky after serv ng as a NABBA
Championsh padjudicator He ed Com-
monweallh in run-throughs of Engllsh
Suile (Lovelock) and Fesrva/ Mrslc (Ball),
stopping frequently lo stress the qua i-
ties that lead to rmprovemenls lo a band
and an individual player.  Also, at  the
start and end ot the cllnic Renlon gave
inspir ing leclures on the enjoyment of
performing music

The Eastefi lowa Bra6s Band (Tom
Nelson)wil hostthe EighthAnnLra Grand
Celebrat ion ofBrass Bands on June 15,
2002 at the Ushers Ferry Historc Vrl-
lage, Cedar Rapids, lA. EIBB wi l l  be
joined by Prair ie Brass Band (Da las
Niermeyer)and ihe l l l inois Brass Band
(Peter Lipar ) .  Concerts siad at 11 a.m.
EIBB are also pedorming at ihe lowa
Bandmasters Associal ion, as wel l  as
giving concerts in Siurg s Cedar Fals
and Kent Park

Conduclorof the Fountain Creek Brass
Band jn Colorado Springs, CO, Paul
Curnow rs moving to Long Beach, CA,
and Debra Baker s assum ng the posi-
l ion ofConductor Debb e stheDirector
ofMusicwith the ColoradoSpr ngs Chr s-
t ian Schools,  and has been FCBB's
Associale Conductor for the past three
years. The band is prepar ng for the r
fourth season of the 'Conced in the
Park" slrnmer series in Soda Spr ngs
Park rn Mani lou Springs. CO a town
nestled between Co orado Springs and
Pikes Peak (from which flows Founiain

Creek).  Duringth sseason FCBB hopes
lo select al least oneAssociate CondLrc-

Motor City Brass Band (Craig Skain)
began lheir2002 season w th lhe Senior
Degree Recital  of  l \ roBB trombonist
Sleve Feltner in Pease ALrdtorum at
Eastern IUrchigan Universi ly Steve
played several unaccompanied before
present ng three solos w th lt4Caai Con-
cerl Pour Trombone El Brass Band
(Grondahl/Straln),  Rhapsody for Trom-
bone (Langford) and Wfd Beneath My
Wings (Henley/Barry) On l\rarch 2
2002, MCBB pa rticipated in the Seventh
Annual Red Cedar Feslrvalof Bands in
Hasslel l .  Ml.  A St.  Patrck's Day
concerl  ,  " l rsh Spectacular ' ,  was the
musical finale of ihe first quader. l\rCBB
showcased a nLrmberol great lr ish lunes
incLud ng a new Craig Strarn arrange-
ment Songs oi  l reland' .  Last years
spec al  guesls Kely Garver (vloln) and
TylerDuncan ( ldsh whist le,  u l leann p pes
and bodhran) returned again this year
and wi lh lhe Cei ic Renaissance lr io
(guitar,Dulcimer and drum) treated lhe
audience io sevefal  high energy new
wave lr ish lunes. Col in Holman v si led
lhe Motor Cily on l\,4arch 25, 2002 to
conducta cl in ictor lVlCBB as i t  prepared
for NAABA 2002.

Pacific Brass (Gonzalo H Viales) re-
cently completed their elevenlh season
Their aci ive schedu e has included con-
certs n CamelValey CA and Hol l is ier
CA. They gave ajo ni performancewith
the Concord CA Salvaton Army Band
last November and a concedclnic on
brass bands for the Calfornia l \ , l | !sc
Educators Associat on n Monterey,
where many educators present were
hearng a brass band for ihe f i rs i  l ime
Mosi recent ly ihey had lhe pleasure of
ieaturing ret red Canadian Brass injm-
peler Ronald Romrn to a capacity audi

The last three monihs have been ex-

tremely busy for the Trianglo Youth
Brass Band (Tony Granados). Cornet
soloist Terry Everson and trombonist
Mike Kris were featured guests of the
TYBB on March gth performing solos
with the TYBB, leading cl inics with the
sludenls, and sharing a recital.  The
conced was pedormed at Meymandi
Concert  Ha l .  the new 63 mil l ion dol lar
performing adscomplex in Raleigh, NC,
one of lhe besl ha ls in the south, and
acoustically designedforlhe Nodh Carc-
l ina Symphony Thea!diencewasvery
receptive. Following lhis concert, the
TYBB set its eyes on preparing for
NABBA in C ncinnat i  Mark Clodfeter,
newly appointed Professorof Trumpel al
the Universi ty of Kentucky and conduc-
iorofihe Smokey I\rountain Brass Band,
came lo work with the TYBB to hep
polish the band for ils pedorrnance n
Cincinnat i  Mark is an intense ieacher
a n d  h a s t h e a b i i t y t o p u l L t h e  m o s l  o u t  o f
the peop e around him His help was
very much appreciated, and TYBB look
forward io working wilh him aga n in the
future. NABBA XX marked ihe TYBB's
second appearance at the annualcom-
pet i ton, competng in th€ Youth Divi
sion and adding more students to the
solo and ensemble compeiitions Both

continuad on page a

Debfa Baker, Fountein Creek Brass
Band
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continued from page 7

trips lo NABBA have been very reward-
ing experiences forallofthe students in
the band. Notonly has ithelpedtheband
to growmusically, bul the sludenls have
grown socially as well. The players
usually see each other once a week al
rehearsaland il was a lol of fun forthem
to spend the whole weekend logether on
thel p. The studenlswould liketo make
the commitment to attend the competi-
tion every year as one of their band
activities. lt is th€ir hope that Youth
Bands form in many more brass band
slpported towns. lt has really been
worlh the effort to experiencelhe resulls
ot what young people can accomplish
when given the opporlunaty. TYBB would
like to lhank allthe dedicaled people in
Cincinnati for hosting awonderful week-
6ndinApri l .  l \ i laylSlhbroughtlheTYBB
back to Bond Park in Cary for lhe tinal
concerl of its Fifth season. Theconcert

Pacific B.ass (Gonzalo Viales)

The Brass Band Bridge June2002

featured fiusicfrom the movies. As they
finishedthis season, they lookforward to
lhe next season of providing a special
musical experience ot the highest cali-
ber to lhe local brass talent of the Tri-
anglearea. lvlanythanks go out to al lof
lhe dedicated peoplewho help to make
the TYBB a special group.

The Sl Louis Brass gand (Keith
Wilkinson) presented S/ides Ru/e/ on
L4ay 12, 2002 at the Orthwein Theater,
I\rary Inslitute-Country Day Schoolin St
Louis with guest lrombone soloist: Erelt
Baker (principal trombone of the Black
Dyke Band and lrombone solo cham-
pion of GreatBdtain). Brettpresenled an
unforgettable evening of pyrotechnical
and lyrical kombone mastery. In addi-
tion to performing solo works wth the
Eand Brettwasalsobofoaturodwith the
STLBB's lrombone section.

Utah Promlero Bras6 (Alan Boyer)con-

cludes its concertseries at Provo Taber-
nacle on lvlay 17, 2002. UPB has
enjoyed a series of five concerts hosled
by Provo City Arts and the concluding
performance from lhis series will bing
together a local school choir, I\,,lountain
Ridge Junior High (Calhy Jolley), in a
performance of Sk l\,,lalcolm Arnold's
Song of Frcedom. Wellknown conduc-
tor Dr. Ralph Laycock will also direcl
IJPB in ihree pieces, and in two ot the
pieces, hewil lbejoined by his daughter.
lhe lalenled vocalist Kalhryn Liltle. Or
Laycock retired from serviceto Brigham
Young University andlhis appearanceis
intended to pay lribute to his e)densive
seNice to music. UPB will perform
PaganiniVadations \l/l.lby) as a grande
finale work. Olher pieces will include
Fanfarc and Flouishe, (Curnow), Mr
Leat's Cahival (Howaih), and Toccata
in D minor lgachlFa.r). A special aG
rangement of The Sla/'Spangled B a n ne,
has bo€n specially prepared by band
member Dr Todd Fiegeland it will hope-
fully b6 madeavaalable in publishedform
in th€ nearfuturo. This arrangementisa
must for bands wantang something
slighl ly differentfrom the normalbut not
wanling lo deviatefrom lhelruo spiril ol
the music. Other conceds in lhe series
have seen the band perfo tm Tuba Mitun
(Wood) Suie /n F (Holsl), Folk Song
suie (vaughan Wlliams), Rhapsody in
Erass (Goflin) as well as the favoriles
Pi ne s of Ron e, Prccession to th e Mi n sler
among others. The linal concerl is
entitled "Heritage" and is designed to
trace lhe inierwoven hislory of Britsh
style brass bands in Europeand Ulah, a
siale that boasted over 100 bands atlhe
slart of the twentieth century. Concert
aitendance has been excellentand UPB
is enjoying a rapidly growing reputation
for its h gh quality performance and er-
tremely enterlain ing programs. The nexl
Provo Tabernacle series will see the
band programming other major works

continuecl on page 9



conlinued ftom page I

including Sounds (Golland) Of Men and
Mourla,ins (Gregson) P6.1tla (Sparke)
and other major as wel las l ighlerworks.
www ula h premte re bra ss o rg

Weston Sllver Bend has had a rela-
lrvely quiel sping as they search for a
new conductor to replace Ron Clayson
who resrgned in December. Robin
McGubbin, a former bandmaster, has
been carrying on very effeclively rn the
i n l e r i m  w i l h  t h e  h e l p  o f  K e  t h
Ketterrngham. The band is hoping Rob
can organize hts work schedLrle so as to
takeonthejob. The band wa s exci ted to
hear of l/larc Donalelle's new venlure in
organrzing the Chicago B€ss Band.
lvlarc the former principal trombone of
the Hamilton Philharmonic Orcheslra,
has filled rn at Wesion on many occa-
sions lrom second bafllone lo principal
trombone until hrs move 10 Chicago
Currenlly WSB are rehearsing fora con-
cert  on May 11 featur ing lhe trumpet
soloist and bandmaster, Bobby Herriol

and also for a busy summer, with four
conceds all falling in one week. The
band has held lwoevenls lhis spring up
to the date of witingt a Slow ldelody
Contesl in January for memberc of lhe
band and an Enlertainment Contesl  in
April with the Vvlitby Srass Band The
Slow lvelody Contest is a means to give
potenlral soloists In the band exposure
and for mature players to show lhem the
way. Nine members of lhe band parlici-
pated and il was mosl exciling to hear
the developmenl of lhe young cornet
payers both front and back bench ln
the end lhe winners chosen by ludge
Alastair Kay were lwo old-tlmers, both
with Welsh backgrounds Principal eu-
phonium Ron Wll iams won for lhe thkd
year in a row and has nowbeen banned
forayear.Gwyn Evans,formerprincipal
cornel who hasjusl  relurned lo lhe band
after sevefal years absence was sec-
ondwith a soulfu I rendilion of"My Love is
Like a Red. Red Rose The band is
please lo have Gwyn back Ln the playing
ranks The Enlertainrnenl Conlesl  with
Wh tby Band has been he d for several

years and provides some fun for all.
Weston played a wide variety of music
including Bees-A-Buzzing, Fest Musik
der Stadl Wein, One Moment in Time,
the delightful Serenala by Toselli. Sol
diers in lhe Pa*, Tancrccli, and con-
cluded with "Seventy Sx Trcmbones".
Starting with the three trom the WSB
section, the band ended with seven as
those who had also played tfombone
joined in-not quite seventy-six but tun
nevertheless. As a point of interest, one
of the judge's scorecard menlioned lhat
the bandwas loo loudfor lhetrombones.
One of the tubas suggested that thal
was an historical firstl The h ghlighl of
Vvhitby's program was a tuba solo in
which the excel lenl  tuba player added a
tLrlu to his clothing half way along and
danced in the aisle as he played. This
gained \/vhitby significant ma*s in lhe
entertainment grading bul not qule suf-
ficientforlhem to overtake Weston who
received lhe trophy for the lhird year
running No one from Weston was able
to be al NABBA this year but we hope lo
remedy thal in thefulure Regardstoal l
from the no longer lrozen Nodh

Brass Band of Columbus (Paul Droste).
March 11, 2002. Eri t ish Arts Fest ival
Olterbein Col lege. Columbus, OH. Fes-
lival March - Celebralian (Condon); Cam-
bndge Vaialions (Spa*e)t Flourish and
Darces(Norbury): Colorel Bogey March
(AllodJ, Concedo for Trumpel mvt. lll
(Sparke).  Dan King, l rumpet soloist ;
Pretucle 49th Pala//e/' (Vaughan VVil-
liams/Douglas). Ovel.we - Henry the
F/t (Vaughan Williams/Douglas)i /
Vow to Thee. My Country lHolsll
Stead man-Al len ) i  Navigat ion lnn
(Sparke), Gary Tirey, conductor
March 2 2A02. 17th Annual God &

Country Concert. l\rerson Auditioium,
Columbus OH wth canadian Staff
Band (Brian Bu.dilt). Liberly Bell
(Sousa)t S/ar'Spangled Banrer (Smith/
Susi), Bill Bailey (Cannon/Susi) Bil
Bailey, soprano cornel soloist: F/oursh
and Dances (Norbury) Ce/ebrat ion
(Condon), Ameican aveiure for Band
(Jenkins/Sarsany) Parade of lhe Chai-
oleers from Ben Hur (Rozsa/Jenkins);
Combined bands: Marchtng Onwad
(Bosanko); Ama?,rg Grace (aff H mes);
Buglefs Holiday (Anderson) I\,,larch-
Pra,se (Heaton).
February 1 5, 2002. 1 8th Annual Concerl

at  St.  John's Church, Columbus. OH
with Central  Ohio Bras6 Band (Tony
Zilincik). Faircsl of the Falr (Sousa); My
F u n n y V a le nl i ne (Rodgets/Swearingen)
Ovenure to Henry fhe F,7t (Vaughan
Williams/Douglas)t Pra,se the Lord wilh
D ru ms & C y m b al s (Katg-ElerVNorbury)l
Deep R,ver(arr. W Broughton); F/ou,st
andDa,rces (Norbury)i Combined bands:
Nalional Emblem (Eagley); My Shep-
,erd (Broadslock); March f@m Pines of
Rome (Respighi/Snell).

conlinued on Page 1A
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Febtary 12,2002. Union CountyCom-
munity Concerl Associalion presents
Hollwvood lveels Uncle Sam, with Paul
"Uncle Sam" Bieralyand Rico"lv lr .  Fi lm"
Long, announcers. Fanfare frcm "2001"
{Strauss/Susi); StaFSpangled Banner
(aft Susi), ColonelBogcy March lAJlotdJl
Libett Bell March (Souse); Over lhe
Rainbow (Arlen & Harburg/Richards),
Lisa Galvin Eb horn soloist; Fallesl o/
theFalrMarch (Sousa)tA Dbney Spec-
lacular(arr. Richards); E/ Capilan March
(Sousa), l\,,lark Bak€r vocal soloist; Pa-
racle oflhe Chaiote€ls lRozse/J enkins);
Mian Te Oyedure-F,rale (Rossini/
Grant); March tlon "1941' \tIr'niamsl
Gal lehue);  Prelude 49th Parcl lel
(Vaughan Wlliams/Douglas); Bil/ Bal-
ley (Cannonlar Susi), Bill Bailey E"flat
cornet soloisl; Armed Forces Medley
(ar. Heine\ J ames Bond Colleclion (a
Richards) i  Sa/val lo,  Army March
(Sousa); God 8/ess Amarica lBetlinlan.
Leidzen), llrark Baker vocal soloisti Sla/s
& Slrpes Forever.(Sousa): Baftle Hynn
o/ lhe Republlc ( Howe/Steffel/Vllhousky
&Ringwald/Susi). l\4ark Aaker vocal so-

Cincinnatl Brasa Band (Anila Huno.
February25, 2002; Cincinnali Conserva-
tory of Music, Cincinnati, OH. Presslrg
Orward (L€idzen); "Bring Him Home"
from Les Mis€rab/es (arr. Wlkinson),
Pal Cou nts, soprano cornet soloisl; Erass
Minialures lo!mow); Hymn lot Didna
(Turrin); James Bond Collection lefi.
Richards); Ihe Huntress (King).

Clinch RivErBras6€s (Lloyd P. Farra4.
City of Norris Communily Building, Norris
TN, wilh guest conductors Paul Bryan
and Daniel Bowles. "La Reiouissance"
from Music for the Royal Fircworks
(Handel/l\rorlimer)i "Sound an Alarm"
from Judas Maccabeus (Handell
Hawkes)i Gems tom Ite St PaulOralo-
no (llrendelssohn/Hawkes); The Ane i-
can Beauty (D'Utbano/F arar)t The Soulh-
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em Slar (Broadb€nl)i lntroaluctan and
,4/e9lo (Fernie), Brian Hodge, eupho-
nium soloisl; ll Guidica Universale
(OeNardis/lvleredeth); 8e Thou My Vt-
s/on (arr. Gordon).

Commonwealth 8.a99 Band (Jerome
Amend). Apil 7, 2002r Indiana Univer-
sily Soulheast, NewAlbany. lN. La Pet
Fanlare (Dukas/Roberts); Ihere's No
Business L*e Show Buslness (Be in/
Richards)t Roblh,4dal(Hartmann), David
Cenlers, euphoniufir soloisl, A Night in
J./re (King), fealuring lhe euphonrum
and baritone seclions; En,gma yana-
Ii o n s, l nl rod u cio n a nc! The m e a ncl N i m ac!
(Elga Ball): The Trouble With Tuba ls
(Relton), Bob Rada, tuba soloist; M€n-
haltan March (Leidzeo);  Fondeau
([iourer/Graham); Somewhete Out The rc
(Horner/8arry)t Cancetlanl1 for Band
lgolla) , The Three Musketaers (H espe)i
I've G ot Rhyth m (Getshwin/Fernie); and.
wilh membersof the Loursville Pipe Eand
The Rose of Kelvingrove {Knox); Skye
Boal Song and Highland Cradle Song
(arr Lamb); Scot/and lhe Brave l'kad I
band parts revised by Amend).

Eastom lowa Braa68and (Tom Nelson)
Aptil20, 2002: Mount Vernon, lA. Na-
lional Anthemt Jubilee Prclude (Spa e).
F anta isie B ill a nle lAdoan), Paul Waech.

cornel soloist; Cambddge Vaiations
(Sparke); Corrolatbfl s (Gregson); 8alt
Dance and Cowboy Hym, (Sparj(e); E
Araniuez, Can Tu ,mor (Rodrigo).
Theresa Anderson, flugelhorn soloist
Ninrod (ElgatJt Pady Piece lspedi.el.
Jordan Fiebelkom, euphonium soloist.
Slavonic Dance No. 1 lD\to€llHanmer)
Amazing Grace (atr. Holcoftbe), Denn6
l\,,lodracek, cornet soloist; Soull' Ram-
pad Slreel Parad€ (Harries).

Golden State British Bra36 Band (Kad
Swearingen). March 24, 2002; Nixon
Presidential Library and lvluseum. in
Yoba Linda, CA, and May4,2002;Soka
UniveGity International Festival, Aliso
Vi€jo, CA. Songso/th6 Quay(Richads)
Harbour Light (Beatcrcll), Noman Tay-
lor, euphon um soloist; Galhoing oflhe
C/an (Duncan); M/sfy (Garner/Barry)
Jane Carter, flugelhorn soloistt Folk Fes-
llval(Shostakovich/CordnetJt Je rus ale n
(ParrylLangford); Conlecion for Brass
(Richards) James Eond Colleclion
(Richards); Concerl March from "1941'
(Wil l iams/Sykes):  Cal l ing Cornwatl
(Richards); Cr.lmond (lrvin€/Richards)
F am ou s B ri! ish M arches (arr. Langf ord)
Clog Dance (Marcangelo/Charleson)
Colonel Bogey (Alfotd) .

Pacitic Brass Band (GonzaloH.Viales)
September23, 2001 ; HiddenValleyMusic
Seminats, Carmel Valley, CA. Srp-
.slream (Sparke); Light of lhe Wotld
(coffin); Demelz€ (Nash), Al Tarasco
tenor horn soloisti Sandon (Purday)
Fanlasy on Srills, Sai/irg sorgs
(Langford); Colonel Bogey (Allotd)
Kaunka lar(.Woodfield): West S,?e Slory
(BernsteinMrighl)i A Ragtime Picnic
lzei,se), Battle Hymn of the Republic
(Wlhousky/Catlinet).
November 3, 2001; St Eenedicl  Church
Hollister, CA. Srpsl,€am (Spalke); Ligrl
of lhe Wotd lco$in); Demelza (Nash)
AlTarasco, tenor horn soloist;Poet and

Send Your
Band News &

Concert Programs
Please scnd your concert

programs and articles onrecent
a.ti\ ities to TII L B R IDC E

W€wantto read
aboutyourband!

continued on page 11
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Peasatl (Suppe); Darce ofthe Russian
Sa/ors (Gliere/Dodd); Colonel Bogey
(Alford); F,'sfSu/fe /n Eb (HolsUHerbed);
Casle Caefi|Ii (Powell): Cazardas(l\/lonti/
Duncan), Howard lvliyata, tuba soloistl
Deep Rlver(arr. Broug h t on): Jingle BeI s
(arr. Broughton)i Armed Forces Sa/ufe
(a(. Bulla) Batlle Hynn afthe Republic
(\ ' i lhousky/Cat l inet)
Apri l  20, 2002; Harlnel l  Col lege Sal inas,
CA wrth'Ronald Romm lrumpel solo-
ist. Casle// Coch (Powell): LiShl of the
World (Gotfin): Light Walk (Goi.l):
"Nessun Dorma" from Turandol (P uccinil
Van Berigan ); Cazandas (l\4onti/Duncan),
Howard Miyata tuba soloisti Cross of
Horour (Rimfier); ruumbers (Rowe);
Fest/ve Oved{./r'e (S h ostkov ch/Kitson );
Purchmelo {Rimmer)i 'La Viryen de la
M ac a re n a (Mendezl F teeh)t " P re I ud e i n
E rrlrol (Chopin/Norr s), *Sleepytine

Dawn Soulh/Swing lhal Music (ar.
Norris); tHol Licks, Hol Llps (Romm/
Norris)i Eaille Hymn of lhe Republlc
(Wilhousky/Cai l inet) .

Prair i6 Brass Band (Dal las Nieft  eyer).
Match 17, 2042t John Hersey High
School Arlingion Heights, lL. Ihe Cos-
sack (Rimmer)i Eal/eiforBand(Horovilz)
Soiree de Sl Petercborr.g (Boehme)
Jay Cohen, cornet soloisii /,sh lul?e
from Counly Derry (G?inget): Far and
Away (Williams); Ihe yeatofthe Drcgon
l9patke): Tyrclean Ttunpets lclaedtl
Wlby),  JayCohen, Mait  Sypherd David
Scherer,  Carol  Dickenson, Jen Judge,
R a n d y  S i e i n b e r g ,  c o r n e l  s o l o i s t s ;
Gae/torce (Graharn); Sadd lewotl h F e sl i-
val (R chards); Amstetdam Hatbour
(Kel ly).

Spiros Brass Band (John Slezak).
February 10,2002; Frederick Ch!rch of
the Brelhren, Frederick, MD TaGodBe
The G/ory (arf. Gordon)i Share My Yoke
(Webb/Bosanko),  Laura Lineberger,  eu-
phonium soloisti Simon Called Peler
(Vinlner);  / ' / /  Walk With God (ar.

Free Ad Space
Available foTNABBA

MemberBands!

The Brers 8an.1 Brklge offers t ttee
Quarter Page Ad on a first come, fi.st
served basis to member bands. The ads
will only bc used if there is unused
space available in the Ariilgc and the
Editor reserves the righ!torevise thead
to fit lhe available space.

The ad spAce can be us€d to sell your
band's new recordings or just !o tell
people youte out lhcrcl Once a band's
fiee ad nppears, thal band will go to
the"€nd of thc l ine. '  g iv ing a l lmember
bands a chancc to use available space.
Send your"camcrarcady" ads.  no larger
than 3 l /2"  by 4 l /2" lo  the Adv€nis ing
Manager Ralph I lo1z.

Spokane British Brass Band (l\Iark
Wlliams). [,,larch 24, 2002; SFCC Audi-
lorium, Spokane, WA. Fanfarc Prelude
(Curnow); Faniasie Billante lArbenl
l\Iuscroft), Jim Phillips, cornel soloist;
Ser.etade (Langford), Eugene Johnson,
trombone soloist; Blaydon Races (ar.
Langford), Richard Evans, baritonesolo-
isl: S bil iana and G ig a (Handel/Langford),
Bruce Brummell, horn soloisl; Eupho-
nium Conceio (Spatke), Kit Cutler, eu-
phonllm soloisti Zebra Fanfare (W-
liams) Demelza (Nash), Joe Pottef,
soprano co rnet soloist; Flg aro's Cavatina
from The Barber o/ Sevi//e (Rossini/
lvarsteller), Ernie Carlson, euphonium
soloisti Sofl/y, 4s / Leaye you (DeVita/
Calheral l),  Ernie Carlson, euphonium
soloist; Ihe Bitish Grenadiers (a(.
Langford)i GrardRuss/a, Fantasia(Levyl
Wyss), l\4att Parker flugelhorn soloisll
Rhapsady in Erass (Goffin); Ihe Sun
Has Got His Hat On lafi. Sparke), Jerry
Olson, iuab sololsl.

Triangle Youth Brass Band (Tony
Granados). ftrarch 9, 2002i Meymandi
ConcertHall, Raleigh, NC. Feslive Over-
iure (Shoslakovich/Kitson); Cleopatn
(Damare), Terry Everson, cornetsoloisl;
Ba Thou My Yislon (Curnow), Terry
Everson, cornel soloisl Air far Tuba
E semb/e (Rodgers), Tuba Euphonium
Ensemblei A Moorslde Sulle (Holsi);
Petit Suitede Balet lgall)t TheGuadian
(Graham), [,4ichael Kris trombone solo-
isl: "Habahera" from Carmen (Bizev
Sp vack), Percussion Ensembei Ito
Doomsday Machine (Burriit), Percus-
sion Ensemble lnsh Tune frcn County
Derry (G?inget): E/sa's Procession lo
lhe Caihedral (Wagner/Himes);
May 18, 2042: Sertorna Amphilhealre,
Cary, NC. 2001 Fanfarc ftom AIso
Sprach Zarathuslra (Strauss/Pearce);
Stnke Up the 8a,d(Gershwin/Richards)i
" Hy mn to th e F al Ie n" fra m S avi ng Piv ate
Ryan (Williams/van derWoude)i Robi,

Richards); Las Lluvias G@ndes IGG-
ha'r,); My Shepherd latr. Broadstock)i
Collage of Conlenparcry Pnise (at.
Hlmes); 8e T/rou My Vision lan. Got-
don): Binging in lhe Sheaves (a rr. H imes);
Hymn la lhe Fallen \aft . van derWoude).
Match 9, 2402; Kussrnaul Thealre,
Frederick Comm u n ily College, Frderick,
MD Statspangled Banner(arr. Himes);
Galheing af the Clan lan Duncan);
"Seville" from Sparish //rpressions
(Newton); Never G/eamed lhe Sea So
Son/y (arr. Brevlk), Luke Spiros and
Laura Lineberger,  e!phonium soloists
Seiers/att (Forde); Hine & Hine \an.
Graham); A Malvem Suile (Spatke):
Windows ta the Wodd (c?ham) . conlinued on page 13
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RIVER CITY BRASS BAND
SIGNATURE SERIES

The River City Brass Band, the nation's premier brass band, is pleased to announce its first
publication catalog. Well.known composers have written many of these arrangements for the
RCBB. lt will also include an original composition by RCBB'S staff arranger Drew Fennell that
combines "Twas The Night Before Christmas" with original underscoring. Also included is
Jenkin's "American Overture for Band and an original piece entitled "Gateway West" and many
other pieces.

To obtain a catalog please call 800-292-RCBB or e-mail defazio@sgi.net

River City Brass Band
PO Box 6436

Pittsburgh, PA 15212

canlinued fram page 11

Hood, Pince of Thieves, Main Tille
Iheme (Kamen/Broadbe nl\ Ba I n a n T he
Movie, Main Title Theme (Elfmar'l
Calheral l ) ;  Ihe James Bond Theme
(Norman/Re ton); You'll Never Walk
A/one (Rodgers/Sne l); The Sound of
Muslb(Rodgers/wf ight); Aohe n i a n Rh ap-
sody (l\4ercury/Barry); Amed Farces
Sa/ule lo N.A.8 B.A. (arr .  Bul la);

Tr iangle Brass Band (Michael Votta,
Jr.  IVusicDlrectof Br ianK. Doyle, Resi-
deni Conductot. Febtuary 17 2AO2;
l \ ,4eymandr Concert  Hal l ,  Raleigh NC
Circius, Wind of the Notlh (Aagaad-

Nrlson); Eyocailorsof Ar English Coun-
i4lside (ar.. Doyle); Euphantun Con-
cerio(Horovitz) Edwardl\Ial ett,eupho-
nium soloist; Variations for Brass Band
(Vaughan Wil l iams), Br ian K. Doye,
conducting; Japanese Slunber Sang
(Wood), Br ian K Doyle, cond!clng.
Yald/es (Hanssen);  Calanel Bogey
(Altord); Ihe Slars and Stripes Farever
(Sousa).
Apri  21,2002; H l l  Hal lAuditor ium Unr-
versi lyofNorlh Caro ina ChapelHi l l  NC
Fanfarc of Pftise (Redhead), Brian K
Doye, conducting; Evocalions of An
English Countryside(an Doy e). Michael
Volta,  Jr,  conduci ing; Tuba Canceno
(Gregson),  Tony Granados luba solo-
ist  Br ian K Doye conduci ing; Badi

nage (Norbury) I\.4ark Mabe. luba solo-
si  Bran K. Doyle. conduct ing: Prayers
fot the Dead (Ma lell): Japanese Slun-
berSorg(Wood) f hunde r and Ltghtntng
Polka (Strauss)
It/ay 5 2002 Chatham County Arts
Counci l  Faci l r tes. Pi i tsboro NC Far-
/a,.eofPralse (Redhead), Bdan K Doyle,
condncling Canlehury Chonle lvan del
RoaslJt Euphaniu m Cance,'to (Sparke),
Randy GLrpt i l l ,  euphonium soloist i  8/ue
Rando ala Turk (Brubeck); Circius
(Aagaard-Ni lson),  Br ian K. Doyle con-
d ucting; Badrrage (Norbury), lvlark lt4abe,
luba soloist; Japanese Slumber Song
\Waod): Thunder and Lightning Polka
(Strauss).
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Everyone is to be congratulated in Cincinnati, from ihe hosts
and organizers (Cincinnat iBrass Band),  to the many part ic i ,
panls lhe sponsots that made the event possible, and lhe
many in the audience who showed to listen, cheer, support,
encourage and be enl ighlened and entedained. The slan-
dards of pedormancewere exceptronally high lhroughout the
weekend and the oarticiDatron wasa reflection ofthe continu-
ing growth ofNABBA. Below are a series of reviews of eve nts
during the course of the weekend that wlll give the reader a
conlrasiing piclure of reveiws by a number of differenl con-
tributors, with results where approprate

YOUTH BRASS ENSEMBLES
Reviewed by Julie Vish

I had the pleasure ofreviewing the youth ensemble section of
the NABBA competition. These small ensembles all exhib-
iled so lid fr.i nda menta I play ing skills and carefu I preparatio n of
their  musical  select ions. The matur i ty of these young mus!
cians is to be commended. l!lr. Richard Holz was the

adjudicator for lhis section.

Theflrst grouplo performwas BrassAlive, repfesenting i-r
Triangle Youth Brass Band. Their pedomance of the f't
movement of the Quintet in Db Malor (Ewald/Jones) $a
excellenlly played with special recognition going lo a.
French horn and first humpet players. I feel that this grcJ
dei ini telywould havebeen inthe runningforplacementi f  l fet
hadusedcornelsandtenorhornasoriginal lycal ledfof Tter
disqualficalion was very unfortunate, but supporled :'a
NABBA instrumenlalron rulesforthe ensemble compel i rc-

Next was Jason's Dance l/lix, a Trombone ensem!{
represent ing lhe Al l  Star Brass and Percussion Tr ' r
ensemble's pedormanceofthe Fugaem Cmfuor(J. S Bac-
was well performed, with excellent dynamic contrasl a',:
pilch. There we re a few sma ll balan ce problems that kept lr s
group from the top position, bul theirsecond place finish E'a3

The winnerof lhe competiUon, and lhe third group lo perfc-
were lhe Four Freaky French Horn Substitutes a h.-
qrarlel 1o.n tl'e Al Sla' A'ass and Percussion This g( -:
was wel l  balanced and played with excel lenl  pi lch, dyna-, :
contrasl  and musical i ty Their  pedormance of the San -.
Scheidt Carzo, was well polished and prepared.

Thef ina groupto performwastheTriangle Youth Tuba4 lqs
ii?). They perforrned The Marriage of Figaro Ovedtr
([,,lozarrFabrizio) This performance was well prepared a.:
the sludents enlhusiasm for the music came ihrough. Tl 'e
third place f in ish was wel l  eamed

As a high school Instrumenta Music Director, I was ve-'
thr i l led to hearal  of  thesestudenls.  Theirhardworkand h,3-
standards for performance was inspiring.

Julie Vish is a comel playetwith the CenlralAhio Band ar.
a nenber ol the NABBA Board of Directots.

YOUTH PERCUSSION ENSEMBLES
Wnner Tr iangle Youth Percussion Ensemble

ADULT BRASS ENSEI/|BLES
Wnnei Derby City Tuba Quartet

militarym usic.com

U.S.Air Force Band
U.S.Army Band

U.S.Marine Band
U.S.Navy Band

plus Ensembles and Choruses
Visitourwebsite and ORDER ONLINE
or order toll-free
800-999-0101, ext. 1 19
FREE CATALOG!

-

Eflltrp"*imcl
Na3hv i l le ,  TN
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ADULT TECHNICAL SOLOS
Reviewecl by Joel Pugh

The adult  iechnical  solo competi l ion
proved to be extremely com pelillve from
a participant's perspective; howeverlhis
allowed for an enjoyable afternoon of
musical entertainrnent for the audience
and some very drfficult decis onsforthe
adjudicator Geoffrey Brand lf addition
to the virtuosic playing thatwas evident
throughout the competilion (another n-
dicat on of lhe musical growlh of NABBA)
practically every instrurnent in the brass
band was represented which gave the
listeners a varied program.

lvlarcra Klne of the Cuyahoga Val ley
Brass Band performed Vrncent BelIni 's
Corcedo onthe Eb Cornet. The andante
sect ion was performed with sensi lve
muslcianship. a l ighttone. and excel lenl
accuracy. The lechnique of lhe al legro
was payed wi ih ighi  cr isp technique
and. in generalwas wel lplayed lhrough-
out

As usual,  the cornet was wel repre-
sented, wiih many of the air varie lype
solos, forwhich this instrumentis known
wonderfully performed. Gabe Kaspefek
of the Pfairie Brass Band gave a very
sold rend tion of the Goedeke Concei
Elude. Ryan Dolan of the Motor City
Brass Band played Jules Levy's G/and
Russian Fantasia His nice big tone
cleaf technique, impeccable tr ip letongu-
ing, and the fact that the piece was
played from memory enhanced Dolans
aggrcssive approach to the piece In
addlt ion to lhe lechnlcal  aspects of the
solo, he was sensrt ive to the muslca
nuances and gave lhe audlence a ireat
by nai l ing the "Eb" al  the end ol  piece
Paul Waech o{ the Eastern lowa Band
perfornred Arban s Fantasie Brillianle
Again, we heard not only amazing lech,
n iq ue, both with fing ers and ad cu lation
but i t  rs always nice to hear these lech

nical solos played musically, andWaech
did just lhat. Cyndi Scoglio also of the
Pralrie Brass Band played thewonderful
standard of Aban/Leidzen, Camival of
yefice. Scoglio huly captured the light
Clafte-style of the cornet and demon-
svated amazing techn que lhroughout
this Umeless select ion.

The alto horn was represented by l\4ichael
West ofthe Lexington Brass Band, who
performed the -ately heatd The Harp
That Once Thro' Tara's Hal/. Wesl
demonstrated a pure al to horn sound
and played with a consistent level of
musrcianshrp, par l icular ly in the caden-
zas. lMy only regret was thal. due totinre
constrarnts hewasnoiabletof nishthe
solo and not being famil iar with thls
plece I  would certainy have enjoyed
hearing lhe resl  of  i t

The audience was treated to two Arthur
Pryor lrombone so os that a ways are
''crowd-p easers Not only did both of
these pieces irJ l f l  a l l  the technical  re-
ql i rements for wh ch these solos ere
known, bLrt also bolh players tru y cap-
lured lhe Pryorsly e that endeared him
self to his isteners. Rob Barnes of the
l l l inois Brass Band exci led the audience
with ihe Pryor slandard Thoughls of
Love. Agar il is always impressive lo
see a performer take a chance and
pedorm ffom memory as Barnes did.
Not only is this pleasing aesthetica ly,
but i t  a l lows ihe performer to internalze
the soo and give ihe absolule best
perlormance. Dave Guion ofthe Pra rie
Brass Band played Love's Enchanlmenl
anddemonslrated amaz ngflexibillty and
very secure high range throughout this

David Shrlver of lhe Brass Band of the
Trislate played GoffRichaAs jazzy Rainy
Day n Ria or bass trombone Shriver
showed excel lenttechnique had a com-
p elecommand ofthepeda rangeofthe
rnstrument and captured the lght jazz
style,  necessary io make this piece

Like the cornet,  the euphonium had
many participants, but the diversity in
the selections of players was partcu-
lar ly pleasrng tothe audience. Si.  Lou s
Srass Bands Jeff  Binns who played
Atban's Vanations an a Tyrolese Song
represented the turn-ot-the century so-
los. Binns performed with a beautiful
euphonium sound and demonshated
greatf lexibi l i ty.  blazing lechnrq!e and a
very3ccuratetripletongue Kentwd man
ofthe Brass Band of the Tr istate played
lhe first movemenl ofJoseph Horovrlz's
andmark pece for euphonrum Cor-
ceio for Euphanrum and Brass Band.
Wellman succeeded in the mostdi f f icul t
aspecl of  lh is solo capluf ng the nrusi-
ca sly e Aftertheperformance Geofirey
Brand mentioned to me that lhough he
conductedlhe premiereand has heard i t
counlless tirnes, he never lires of hear-
ingthls great selecl ion. Lexinglon Brass
Eand's Tony Wise treaied lhe audience
to one of lhe newef classics in the
euphonium repertoire, Eu phony by Rab-
ert Redhead. S nce no piano accompa-
n ment exists,  (and Hospital i ty Suite
#301 was not large enough lo house the
Lexington Brass Bandl) Wise pedormed
a capella. Frorn the outsel the exciie-
ment n ths piece was evdent.  He
demonstrated a ful l  eLrphonium sound
and perfomed wth mpeccable tech-
nique. Especial ly impressve was the
cr isp double ionguing in lhe asl  seci ion
of the solo Scott Heath of ihe Brass
Band of Columbus educated the audF
ence in a non-brass band seleclron
wri t tenforBrian Bowman al  the Leonard
Falcone Competi t ion at the Blue Lake
FineAds Camp; David Gi I  ngham s B/ue
Lake Fanlasies Heath chose to per-
form thef irst  and ast movemenls ol this
programmaticp ece, 'Firef ly"and'Party
Anl ics '  Heath pushed the envelope
in terms of tempo and t ceriainly paid

cantinued on page 16
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dividends by providing a truly exciting
renditaon ot this wondedul piece His
flawless technique, attention to dynam-
ics, and smooth flexibility helped in
making this a realaudience favorite.

The mosl popular lheme and variation

solo, originally writlen fortuba is Catozzt's
Beelzebub and lhis selection was pec
formed by the Sunshine Brass Band's
Tod Markin Markin's rendition of this
piece was very solid and captured the
light-hearted style lhat endears these
select ions lo lhe audience. Chris
Combesl of lhe Lexington Brass Band
chose Monli'sgypsy violin solo Csardas.
VVhilelhis piece has be6n transcribedfor
virtuallyevery instru meni, lhe fe issome-
lhing especially thrilling about hearing
th is piece played on B Bb tuba. Combest
demonstreled a rvonderfu I sense ofmu-
sicjanship in lhe rubalo opening section
and then showed viduosic technique in
the remainder of the solo

l iwas noton ylhe brass thal  showedfine
solo playing this afternooni severalper-
cl.issionisls played enjoyable selections
on the rnarimba to give the complete
array of m usica I diversily lllinois Brass
Band's Teralyn Schwab performed lhe
Spanish selection. Aslu,as Leyenda by
Albenirslensgaard. Schwab's perfoc
mance was mafted by extremely emo-
t ionalplayingcompiementedbysmooth
flowing technique lhal combined for an
inspiring perf ormance.

The lhree winners of the compelition
certainly were-deserving, allhough any
numberof lhepreviously menlioned par-
trcipants could also easily have placed.
The third place winnerwas Tony Zi l incik
of the Brass Eand ol  Coumbus and
C e n t r a l  O h i o  B r a s s  E a n d  p l a y e d
Goedeke's ConcerlElude as fasl as l've
ever heard it (l think he was concerned
aboul lhesix-minutet ime l imit l )  Notonly
was il a tempo of one lo the bar (Jayne
Canady, the accompanist, should also
be commended for keeping up wjth the
soloisl) bul it was absolulely flawlessl
Wel l{onel l  Oh, by the way, Zi l incik
played lhe Conced Etude for Tru mpet on
Eb tubal

which eamed hera second place resull
Cerlajnly a crowd favorite, N€lson dem-
onstrated a lruecornet sound, efforlless
technique, and careful atlention to dy-
namics, which resulted in a thrilljng ren-
dition of this familiar solo. As if an
almosl-perfect performance wasn t
enough, Amy and hef accompanisl
Steve Marcus, "hammed it up" to gNe
some levity to lhis serious occasion

The winner of lhe Adult  Technical  Com-
pelition was Dewie Dowdy ofthe Brass
Band of the Tristate who played Ean
Halch's Fuioso and Yalse on the ma'
rimba. The technique Dowdy demon-
slraled in the Furioso was phenomena
and the lighl-headed vals€ seclion prG
vided the perfect com plimenl to lhe piece
As with severalof lhe other performers
heperformed lhe solo by memory, which
allowed him even more artistic ireedorr
to put his own personal touch on lhrs
win nrng perlormance.

Alllhe part'cipants should be cong.alu'
laled for e great afternoon of musrca
enjoyment. l l  is evident lhat hours ofhard
work lhatwent into each ofthese pedor
mances. Also, i t  rs no secret lhat lhe
ind ividua I players make bands greal anc
lhis is one of the main reasons lhat lhe
level of lhe NABBA bands conlinue lc
ise

Joel Pugh is directot of lhe Heidelbery
B /ass B and and a me m bercl th e N AB B a
Board of Dheclors

ADULT SLOW MELODY
Reviewed by David Ros6n

The we€k-end of NAaBA XX was a very
well staged event by the C incinnali B ra ss
Band and DwightWages and Crew The
"Adult Slow [relody" compelilion was an
excel lent exhibi t ion of musicianship. A
very high degreeof interest in tine brass

Amy Nelson of the l l l inois Brass Band
pedormecj Arban's Camival of Venice,
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NABBA
RENEWAL DATE!!

March 1

This date holds forall mem-
bers and memberbands.

ALL Registrations at
NABBA will be based on

ExecutiveAdministrator Bert
Wiley's Listing.

Be sure you and your band
are renewed. You may be

charged a registration fee at
NABBA

if you are not registered by
thattime.

New members registering
during the year may be

eligible for back issues of
The Brass Band Bddge

whereavailable
Contact BertWileyat:

P.O. Box 2438
Cullowhee, NC 28723

Telephone: (828) 293-7 469
E-mail bemelw@gte.net
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playingwas evident given thevanetyand
quality of literature prepared and pfe-
senled. All of lhese aspecis of the
compelition put an edditional degree of
pressure on Judge Frank Renton in lhe
final selectiont especially after a day
filledwilh so ma ny wonderfui solo perfor-
mances. At lhe conclusion of each
presenter's seleclion I was everrnore
re ieved to be announcing and nol adj !-
dicaUng. Atthe end of lhe day and after
a long period of consideration Maestro
Renton awarded the first place prize to
t fombonist Br ian Byrne of lhe l l l inois
Brass Band. Congratulat ions to al l  par-
I  c ipants.

David Rosen is a memberofSolid Brass

YOUTH SOLOS
Reviewed by Jacksan Hill

I was given the privilege to be ihe an-
nouncer for lhe Youlh Solo Drvision at
NABBA l t  was a pleasurab e oppodu-
nity to listen to the wonderful talents oi
ihese i ine young musicians. The future
of brass bands is truly alive and well
wi lhin the youth divis ions.

I would like to congratulate all the partict,
pants ior a job well done A special
ovat ion goes to Dwight King, basstrom-
bone, for f i rst  place Jason Walkns,
lrombone, for second place and David
Root marimba, Iof th rd place.

All ihe perforrners showed great prepara-
tion which is a tesiameni to their in skuc-
tors and brass band programs. The goal
of mastering an instrument is a major
priority. Overall the musica selections
weredif f icul t .  Musicians should stdve to
f ind musicthat ischal lenging yet s i i l lbe
wrthin ones ski l l  evel.

Ilrany ofthese student so oists would be
a greal asset to any senior bfass band.

I personally envy the youth programs
that are being developed. This is lhe
future of brass bands in Nodh America
I am hoping in lhe future to develop a
program in our area. I encourage more
bands across the counlry to develop
lheseprograms. The youth rn o!rorga-
nzat ion work in conjunct ion with the
col leges and universi t  es in lhe area to
earn credits fortherrensemb ewotkw th

lam looking forward lo Li t t le Rock2002.
lwould l ike to see more al lo horns and
baritones perform in the solo compeli-
t ions. This would real ly help bui ld lhese
seclions with your band.

Once again congraiuletons to al l  the
performers In lhe youth soo divsion.
See you in 2003i

Jackson M Hill is a barilat)e player and
founder of lhe Brass Band of the Tri-
Stale and a nenber af lhe NABBA
Board of Directors

LEXINGTON BRASS BAND CONCERT
wilh Vlncenl DiMa.t ino
Reviewed by Chuck Wyrick

NABBA members their  guests and ihe
Greater Cincinnat i  Conrmuni ly were in-
deed foriunale to have the Lexington
Bfass Band, wi ih guest trumpet sooist ,
V ncent Djlvarlino, present a conced al
the close the frst  day of ihe NABBA
Championships.

The program opened wth lhe WrLliafir
Himes arrangement ofthe Star Spangled
Banner which was far from a roliine
perfo|mance of TheAnthem, butrathera
stirring m niature tone poem. Next was
Clifton Williams's Dramatic Essay pel
formed by Mr DiMartino which demon,
straied his amp e vrduos ty and lyr ical
style Edward Grieg's lhe L€si Spnng
lram Two Elegiac l / le ladies (at l
Sleadman-Allen) v,,as a wonde.f ul f rame
work for the bands overal l  nch tone

qual i ty with bealt i fu l  paying on this
piece by the principal solo cornetist.
Following was the "Humoresque'r from
Erik Leidzen's Folk Sorg Su/te followed
by soloist and first lrombonist, David
Henderson's beautifui legato playing on
"Berceuse" (Angels Guard Thee) frorn
lhe opera Jocelyn by Benjam n Godard,
lranscribed and arrenged by Eric Ball.
Afler a very humoro!s introduction by
VincentOil\rarlino. he perfomed Godon
Langford's Rhapsody for Tlumpet and
Srass Earddescribing i t  as'Holy Jazz."
Next on slage 1o conducl was one ofthe
several  dis l jnguished judges for the
Championships, Geoffrey Brand lead-
lng the band in a prerniere of Er ik
Leidzens Abide Wilh Me) and whal a
d fferent treatmenl of this old hymn it
was, with ts never thick but rather l ight
and transparent texture wilh many ex-
posed passages - a chalenge lor any
brass band. "Hymn to the Fallen" from
the movie Savrrg Private Ryan llf./|-
liams/van der Woude) was then given a
very poignanland mov ng reading bylhe
band. The boisterous Pasllme l,Y/t/)
Goad Company (Henry Vl l l /Stephen
Robeds)could have ended the program
bul lo cool things down e b t  and pl i  an
exclanr at on mad( on lhe co ncert V ncent
DlMarl no rellrned lo lhe stage to pec
lorm the pop! ar and powerfulana from
P9ccini's Turandal.

One nolable aspect that made this such
an enjoyable concert  in addit ion to the
finepedoffnancesbythe Lexrngion Brass
Band. soloisl  Mr D Mart ino and guest
conductor Mr Brand were the e oquent
introduclrons by the LBBs conductor,
Dr Rona dHoz \Mth awordsmilh of this
ca iber, there s no need for a pfofes-

Chuck Wynck is a menber af lhe Cin-
dnnau Brass Band

continued on page 18
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INTEREST SESSIONS

This year's hosts incorporated a series
of brief and informal seminars on lhe
Friday evening to bolh enlighlen and
educate newerand expereinced NABBA
memberc alike on a number ot lopics
pertinent lo lhe organ izalion. Sev€ralof
thesessions appearbelowwith asynop-
sis of lhe male.ials in the discussion,
and fu rther details can beobtainedfrom
the conlributors to each session.

HOSTING THE NABBA CHAMPION.
SHIPS

This interest session \,i/as conducted by
two prioa NABBA Championship llosls:
l l l inois Brass Band - 1999 (Lisa Bames
& Jeff Lyons), and Cincinnali Brass Band
- 2002 (DwightWages). Therc was awell
atlendod sessionwith 13 NABBA mem-
bers availing themselves to the presen-
tation, with lots of good queslions from
theaudience. Presentw6rerepresenta-
tives from the Commonweallh Brass
Band, Syracuse lJniv Brass Ensemble,
Li t t le Rock Brass Band, and Sunshine
Brass Band (apologies lo olher bands
represenied, ifyou are not listed). llwas
especially encouraging to see nextyeals
host (Litlle Rock) pres€nl with several
members as they get geared up tor next
April.

A three page ouiline ot the key areas
which should be considered and se-
cured in preparationforhosting a NABBA
Championships was presented. These
included: 1) volunteer Recruiting &
OEanization of Steering Commiltee, 2)
Commiltee roles/ responsibililies, 3)
Responsibilites of the NABBA Board at
lhe Championships, 4) Securing the
Venue Locations (hotel, performance
locations, reception), 5) Percussion
EquipmenVNABBAlogowear/ Programs,
6) Schedul ing, 7) Communicat ions
(Website, host - band liason coniacts),
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8) NABBA Weekend Logistics, and
finally 9) Posl-evenlfollow-ups& NABBA

There were some good frank questions
and the leaders of the sessions gave
feedback on lhe commitment that each
band musl have from their tul lmember-
ship i f  planning on undedaking the re-
sponsibility of hosling. Emphasis was
given lo getling early commitment (mini-
mumof 1 year, preferably2 years)forthe
ven ues and gala concert enledainmenl.
The imporlance of preparing a prelimi-
nary budget with a focus on eslimaling
howlhe hosts expecl to raise the funds
lo cover lhe expenses for th e Ch ampion-
shipswas addressed. ll was suggested
that potenlial hosls use this as a basis
for deciding whether th€ band can ex-
pectloemergef nancially in good shape,
sinceonewould nolwant a host band to
end up wilh a significanl deficit. And
laslly, the importanceof planningtohave
top quality percussion equipmenl avail-
able for bolh lhe perfomances and re-
hearsal sessions was stressed.

Several of lhe members in aitendance
requested a copy of the Hosting Plan-
ning Book - Competilion Menual which
the NABBA Board had prepared in 2001.
These names have been passed onlo
Anile Cocker Hunl, for dissemination of
lhismanual In addi ion. Dwighl,  Jeff&
Lisa offered to consull wilh any bands
whoareconsidering oralreadyagreed to
host a future Charnpionships. As we
fudher refin€ lhe Hosting l\ranual, and
b u i l d  a  g r o u p  o f  p r i o r  h o s t i n g
consultants. . . . . .  . . lhe experience oi
hosl ing, whi le no smal l  task can with
goodadvance planning be avery gralify-
ing andunifyingeventfora NABBAband.
Submitted by Dwight Wages
wagesd@mindsping.com

HOW TO START A YOUTH BAND

people stopped us lo ask questDr6
about our bend throughout the weekend
We were morethan happy to sharewh4
we kn6w. The following queslions anc
answers are dEwn trom our converc+
tions over the weekend. lt is our hopa
thatthis a rticle will encou rage peoplelc
sta.l up youth bands an theirarea, and lc
use lhe NABBA compelitions as a ve-
hicle to enhance lheir musical abilit

Ouryouth bend is stillawork in progress
Whal6 w€ are really excited aboul lh.
ensemble at has become, each year w!
f ind some areas that need jmprovement
We are slillreally in our infancy. Thrngs
are coming together nicely, and ead
yearbringsnewl€arningexperiencesfo.
the people in chargeofmaking lhe TYBB
a good mus cal producl. The vision islh.
most importanl part of starting a youl:
band. We ar€ trying to provide l,.'
highest quality ensemble for lhe bes
players we can find. I\rusical excellenc.
is the primary tocus, with a seconda'r
tocus beinglo inslilla lovetorbrass baE
playing in young players. By playrng .
concert in lhe n€w symphony hall, bnng'
ing in guest artists, and travellrng E
NABBA each year, we hope to allra
frne tal€nl andcontinueto imploveeve.!
aspect of the TYB B each year. We do.:
focuson competition. The NABBA lrlp.
just one of the lhings we try to do =
provde a comprehensive learning expa
rience. lt look the TYBB tour years ts
make it to a NABBA comp€tiiion ara
lhal heppened because ihe timrng wa
jusi nghl.

What were you. firs! steps?
In lhe spring of 1997, the Ttiangle Blas.
Band (TBB)held Brass Day in Durharn -
a p€rformance hall. Students from hEr
schools lh roughout a 3-cou nly arca wera
invited to participate. The clinicwas hec
on a day when the TBB had an evenhq
concen planned in the same vent.

The session on starting a youth brass
band had few padicipants, bul many

continuec! on paqe
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Sludents attending Brass Day also re-
ceiv€d a complimentary lickel to thal
concert. The day began with a program
forall students on thedifference beiween
blass bands and concert bands. TBB
membets demonstrated brass band in-
slrumenls. Awell-known musician led a
masler class, TBB borrowed a second
sel ofbrass instru ments for the day and
the sludenls spent about an hourand a
halfreading brass band musicend play-
Ing brass band instrumenls - lhat really
sold the students on lhe idea offorming
their own band. The Triangle Brass
Band'scommitmenlto hostingthis Brass
Oay was essential to the begin ning of the
youlh band. Our successfu I youth band
has come from our successtul adult
band, using their resources as our jump-
ing-offpoini.

Where did you get yourinslruments?
The adult band was ready lo begin up-
g tading their insku ments. As a section s
inslrumenls were replaced, the older
rnslrum€nls were passed down to ihe
new youth band. Ouf first year we had
cohels and flugelhorn. Students in
olher sections played their school in-
slrumenls. (Yes, we had french hornsin
our youth band.) Two years later we
were able to add ten or horns. Thefourth
year of lhe band we had barilones for
tnom l0 use.

Wo directs your youlh band?
The director has so far been a member of
our adult band. The firsl semester we
had 4 directors sharing the responsibili-
ties. This did nol work well for the
sludents - they needed more consis-
tency. From the second semester on,
only one person regularly directed the
band Jusl as band directors atschools
become actavely involved in lhe lives of
lheir studenls, our band direciors have
spenl a lot of time away from rehearsals
communicating with our students. The
direclor needs to have a good rapport

wlth kids, a link to band directors and
olher musicians in the area, and a lot of
time to devote to the project A very
imporlantquality a youlh directorshould
possess is the abilily to inspire.

How do yau selec! lhe sludents to be in

Ou. members are all high school stu-
denls. We trylo have an equalnumber
from each grade. Selection forTYBB is
by recommendalion and audition. We
do not have open auditions. Ourdirector
learns who the best high school brass
players are and then recrlits them to
play an the band. He checks lhe All-
Diskict and All-Stale lists. lt hetps to
networkwithlhe area banddirectorsand
pdvate instructors a nd lodevelop a rela-
tionship wilh then. lf they supporl the
band, they will readily recommend slu-
dents. We have fou nd it useful to enpha-
size lo the local band direclors that our
sludents are always excused f rom brass
band functions il they conflicl wilh a
school band function

When do you rchsarse?
We began with rehearsals on Sunday
aftemoons from 2 00 - 4:00pm The
theory was that sludents had more free
trme on weekends and could fit a re-
hearsal in beforo they attended youlh
aclivities at lheir churches in the eve-
nings. We had some problems wiih
atlendance on Sundays. Families visil
relatNes on weekends, science pOecls
and English papersarefrequentlydueon
lvlondays, and school trjps are usually
scheduled over weekends. This past
yearwe changed to Tuesday nightsfrom
6130 - 8r30pm. We sl i l l  have some
problems with attendance as schools
schedule conceds and honor society
meetings and basketball games on week-
nights, but it is much better. We chose
Tuesday nighls alterchecking wilh olher
local groups. The youlh orchestra me€ts
on lvlondays; our adtilt band meets on
Wednesdays; and our school district
frequently schedules theirworkdays (stu-

dent holidays) on Fridays so families
leave town onThu6day evenings - this
meant Tuesday was the besl for us.

Two hours is a lengthy rehearsal for
sorne players. Th€ sludents take a 10-
15 minute break half way through lhe
rehearsal. Asadull brass players know,
the playing in brass bands is more de-
manding lhat in regular band. Many
students have to build up their enduF
ance for it.

We schedule at least flve rehearsals
b6fore a concert, bui we recognize lhal
they are not as polished as the concerts
performed afterS org rehearsals. We do
not schedule any rehearsingjusl priorio
concerls- It necessary, wewillhave a 5-
7 minutesound check and then givethe
sludents 30-45 minutes of resl betor€
the conced begins.

Tell ma aboul your season.
After a couple ofyears ol trying lo begin
rehearsals eady in the fall, we finally
acknowledged lhat we could not com-
pelewilh marching band programsrnthe
schools We have audilions in late
Octoberand begin rehearsals lhe week
after the last major marching competi-
tion. We schedule a concerl in mid-
December and then take off tor Chrisl-
mas break. We try to schedule a con-
cert in late February to mld lrarch.
Rehearsal is suspended the week of
sp ngbreak The lasltwo yearswe have
competed at NABBA (which we hope lo
conttnue to do each year). we then
finish our season In mid May with an
ouldoorconcen The lasttwoyears lhis
I\ray concert has featured music from
movies and musicals At the end oflhis
concerl we collect all the instruments
anct musrc.

Whal kind of music clo you play?
Themusic ispartly from the TBB library.

continued on page 21
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We have also purchased some new
musicforthe band. We wantlhe music
to be interesting, educationaland chal-
lenging. They play advanced lilerature
like "Moorside Suit6" and "Festive Over-
ture" as well as easier tunes like "Be
Thou My Vision" and "Danny Boy." We
wantlhesludenls lo play a broad range
of music from kadilional brass band
repertoire to orch€stral transcriptions
and solo pieces. lt is important to play
fi usic that is interesting and challenging
to hjgh school musicians l\,,lost ot lho
players are looking for the challenge,
and might lose interest quickly i f lhey did
not get it.

Enduranceduring a performanceshould
be taken inlo consideration. A 45"m in ute
concert is loo short, yet many students
(mostly cornets) will have kouble mak-
ing it lhrough a ful lhourand a half.  even
with inlermission. We have suppie-
mentedthe band perfo.mance by adding
a percussion ensemble seleclion on
each concerl. This also provides our
percussionisls some exlra work since
lhe band music is not always challeng-
ing for lhem. During the concert, this
piece is good for about 7-10 extra min-
utes of p€rformance wthout using up
cornetchoptime. Ourluba/euphonium/
ba ritone sectio n s h ave also performed a
Tuba Ensemble selection. Plans in the
fulure also include a trombone choir.
Comets and tenothornscan rest upa bil
durang these tlmes.

Do you charyg clues?
Our students pay dues al the first re-
hearsal each year. This year il was
$60.00 per student. We may have a
studenl or two with a financial problem
that causes ihem to be late, but it has
not been a problem. This money pays
lhe rentforthe rehearsal space, provides
for new music, and helps pay forguests.

Vvhat would you lika to change?

We continue towork on audience devel-
opment which is a problem for almost
everyamateurgror.ip in outarea, we are
also working to improve eltendance at
rehearsals. We are also studying the
idea of some kind ofcorpo€te sponsoc
ship so that we don't have lo charge
dues. Thal wou ld mak€ performing even
more of an honor. We teel that if the
studenls can play and travel and work
with famous people torfree. itwould be
thatmuch morevaluable andwould help
wilh recruiling down the road. We would
also liketo have more perfomances, so
lhe band feels more like a performing
ensemble ralher than a r€hearsal en-
semote.

Whatarelhe besl aspecls ol you band?
We provide some of lhe besl brass
players in lhearea an opporlunityto play
consistently challenging music. Many
sludents and parenls lell us they are nol
challenged in their school music pro-
grams We believe we are helping the
school band programs educale and
malure lheir members. Our sludenls
really enjoy playing logelher. We also
expose our members lo world class
brass musrcians through NABBA lr ips
andvisits by guesl conductors andfriends.

Sumilted by Caralyn Kohing and Tony
Granados, Carolyn Kohnng is Busness
Manager af bolh Triangle Erass Bands.
Sha has a/so be€,, a "Band Mom" with
the Youlh Band since il began in 1997.
Tony Granados is Dircclor ol lhe Ti-
angle Youlh BrassBand and playsluba
wilh lhe Tiangle Brcss Bancl.
thbngt@attglobal.net

SOME THOUGHTS ON RECRUITING

The Interesl Session on Recruitingdrew
asmall, blt inlerested aud ience. Those
who attended were presented with a
variely oflhoughtson the recrufting pro-

The firsl main point in recruiling was to

stress the uniqueness of playing in a
brass band: the b€autiful organlike
sound ofa brass ba nd, lhe differenl (and
increased) challenges for brass players,
the exciting and vari6d literalure, and the
rewardsof playing in a musical organiza-
tion with like-minded adults. Also men-
lioned was the opporlunily lo become a
pariof NABBA and to attend and partici-
pate in lhe annual championships, re-
ceive lhe newsletier, and develop now
contacts and friends.

The second main pointwas logothrough
the inslrumentation of a British-style
brass band and develop crite a for tho
recruiling of playersforeach instrument
The technicaldemands within th6cornet
seclion provided an example of where
adva nced players were crucial (solo a nd
Eb soprano), and where role players
would fil jn the band (second and lhird
parts). In the evenl that French horn
playeF are notwilling lo play alto (tenor)
hom. cornet and lrumpet players could
be switched with relative ease.

The lhird major point was the need lo
have a smal l  group of enthusiasls who
are slrcng players become a reference
pornt forf i l l ing out ihe band Thereisihe
danger of allowing marginal players lo
become members r ightat the beginnrng,
only to have lhe problem of replacing
them when they cannot keep upwith the
leveloftheband. lt is belterto starl small
and build carefully Do not be afraid to
recruit players from existing communily
wind bands and orchestras because
many ofthem want to play in more than
onegroup

A final point of discussion was whelher
to audilion playels. let lhem sit In a
rehearsal or tv/o without obligatron on
either side, or to use the Gcommenda-
t ions of ihe current players to f i l l
vancancies. Perhaps a combination of

conlinued on page 22
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these could be used. lnsisl thal new
membeas make a commitment to regu-
lar allendance al rehearsals and con-
cens,

Paul Droste is lhe conductor of lhe
Brass Eand ofColumbus and an HonoL
ary Manber of NABBA

ENTERING A NABBA COMPETITION

Formany bands, playing in NABBA is an
annual highl ight,  an imporlanl  part  of the
gro\ dh andthedireclion ofa brass band,
and a focal point of the perfofinance
calendar. Brass bands who participate
spend considerable amou nls of fund ing,
perconel and organizatjonal, lo allend,
and this investmenl should be balanced
by car€ful preparations. But for lhose
thinking about taking the plunge lor the
f i  rs l t jme, whyshouldoneenler,  and how
doesonego about preparing forsuch an
event?

lls possible lhat you may have lo begrn
by convincing the enlire ensemble lhat
lhis rs aworlhwhile venture. Competition
ls an important part  of(most)brass band
calendars and have been so since lhe
insligation of brass bands, in bolh lhe
UK, Europe, Auslralsia AND No h
Amenca, and there are historical rea-
sons tor entering.

. . . il was compelition wilh olher b'ass
bands lhat gave fthe eady brass bands
in Americal dynamsm and lhe will lo
improve. Wdespread even in lhe eali-
e st d ays of Ih e movemenl, g aod-n atu rcd
ivalry slimulated amateur bands ta pl ay
more oflen, to dress more attnctively,
ancl lo practice more diligenlly. Rivalry
among towns and companies can even
be satd lo have led ta the formalion of
many bands in lhe fist plece_

There was fierce conpelilion far.good
musrcal arrangements as well... In one

incidenl, long remembered by rcsidents
of Batlle Creek, Michigan, thecetmania
Band upslaged a neighbaingbandtrcm
8ay CiU by playing one of Bay City's
onginal pieces, hul in a fat betler aL
rangenenl, cluing tho very sane con-
cetl at whbh Bay CiU band prcmiered

Ultimalely, however, lhe only meaning-
ful way lo eslablish one band's superi-
oity ovet anolher was to fight it oul in
concei. Such "windy wars" as a New
Oleans newspaper called lhem, werc
common occunences in the nineteenth
century. On city slreel comes, in lhe
middle of parcdes, ancl even on lhe
decks ort pass/rg steamboals, rival
bands lied to oulshing the competition
with lhe quality, not lo menhon lhe
valume, of lhei playnq. Si',ilar musi-
cal batlles, waged by Confedercte and
Untan bands dunng lhe CivilWar, have
becone le9enclary.

These spontaneaus play-offs Bvolved
into a highly organized fotum lor band
compelilions known as band conlesls
or lournaments. Sponsored vaiously
by in sltu me nt conp a n ies rcg ion al b a nd
associalions and chambers af cam-
merce, band conlesls catercd lo lhe
competilive nature of bandsmen while
offeing mare langible rcwads As
Trumpel News pointed out in 1877, a
band could learn mare frcm one 'well-

regulaled band conlest lhan [from]
monlhs [aq the ordnary raulneofbancl
praclise " ln addilion ta lhis educa-
lianal function, band toumaments of-
fered palicipation an opparluni!y lawin
fanlashc phzes af cash orinslruments
lnanecontesl, held in Fremonl, Ohia, in
1884 lhegrand pize was a wagon worth
lwo lhousand clallars plus fwe hundred
dollars in gold Needless lo say, win-
ning can]pelitions was anolher way a
band could raise money!

Band contests became very papular,
especialy duing lhe 1 87As and 1880s

Some of lhe /arye ores, srch as lia
thrce anal four day toumaments h*
annually aI Marancook, Maine, and Ever+
vil le, l ndi a n a, attractad both am ale u t a|a
professional bands along with lhousaD6
of speclalors. Olher competilbns we't
small-scale affairs, fealuing a few lc,c.
bands and perhaps a lew dollars in pfta
noney for lhe winning bandsmen E
tuatler how Ihe contesls were admtns
lered, lhe oppoftunilies they provided It
bandsmen to hear each other and pla.
logether went a long way towarcl fuehn;
lhe dynamism ol lhe Amaican amate.,

I\rargaret Hindle Hazen and Robert ll
Hazen The Music Men lwashtngru'
Smiihsonian Inst i lu le Press, 1987).  66

The following g!idelines might be usec

1 Commit the band to entering T\.
sounds obvious, but a firm commilme.r
means belter planning for a dedrcal€c
performance. Persuedethe membersnc
(if they need persuading) that plann .;
earliermeansensuring hotel space. g@
rates for travel by landorair, and ensuFr;
lhose thal need time from wo* can ta.t
t offwithoul a problem PlentyofNAgB.r
padicipanlsb ng thefamily and make a'
entire weekend out of it lt's great soc.
and mus caibonding t imeforthe barr-
ask anyone who has attended befoa
The biggest stumbling block lo com-.
ment is of  course f inancial .  Some ba.: !
pay the membership's entire expens.r
to atlend, some bands partralLy s!5
dize and olhers expect members to -.
their  ent i re way. Your decision w l l  *
pend on your band's phi losophical  cJ
look. Having a band pay lherr way e'.
sures a higher level ol commitmenl a.
causeof lhe individual investments be.E
made, but it also may result in n\t..
members not wanting to invesl or at
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being able lo aftord an airfare and two
nights in a holel room. Expecting the
bandlo pay places an enormous burden
on an ensemble lhat for mosl have lim,
ited budgets, butthis approach may help
memberc to commit. lt's a tough choicel

2. Readthecontestrulescarefully. Com-
municate concerns or queslions to the
conlest conlroller well in advance ityou
arc unclearaboutanyprocedures. Share
lhese with lhe band. Be sure that you
also adhere to deadlines for submission
ot malerials. Keep in touch through the
Brass Band Bridge and especial ly
through the electronic resources plo-
vided by hosts on a yearly basis.

3. Pick an appropriate section lo enler.
Th€re are no regulations as to which
section a new band should enter. I\rost
beginning bands enler the Challenge
Seclion orlhe Explorer Seclion, but new
bands have entered higher sections as
first lime entrants and been quite suc-
cessful. Use the test-piece seleclion as
a g! idel ine lo your band's abi l i t jes.

4. Lislen lo recordings ot the test-piece
if available. Allhough lhe lasl thing one
wants to hear rs a carbon copy perlor-
mance, recordings of brass band music
by established and recogn ized top-level
brass bands can be ofgreatbenefatlo ali
brass bands, but especially lhose less
experienced. This isvaluable nol juslfor
lhe MD but lor al i  the membership.
Preparelhe lesfpiece as thoroughly as
possible.

5. Select wise own choice(s) music
Each band is required to flllthe remain-
ing l ime in their  program (depending on
lhe section entered) with own choice
music from "the best of brass band
repedoire." Your selections will be de-
lermined by the guiding a.listic philoso-
phjes of your band. Less experienced
bands like lo starl lheir prog€ms with

something short and comfodable, a
march for example, lo help them settle
in, acclimatize 10 the aco!slic, settle lhe
jiltars, and leave a good impression on
lhe adjudicators. Other bandsare ready
to jump right in to somelhing more sub-
stantial. The order of pieces is not so
important as the items themselves. lt
does no harm to finish et a climaclic
poinl ,  bl t  pick music that you wrl lsound
good at, that will help develop the band
beyond the scope of the competition.
and ihal artislically balances the test-
piece lo develop and display yourllexibil-
ily Show your skengths, but use your
choic6sto improveon yourweaknesses
technically and musically.

6. Consider timing, balance, and skills.
Bear in mind the time limitations, both
minimum and maximum wh6n making
yourown choicemusicselect ions. Prac-
lice liming. Practice selting up (percus-
sion needs, especial ly) andtuningw hin
the allolted tine allowances. Practice
as many l imes as possiblejusl  running
your Progran and l ime i l  for lenglh
There should be no excuse for a band
playing overor under the t ime l imits i  this
rs just poor preparation and needless
penalty points for lhe band

7. Praclice all aspects of performance.
P€pare as much as possible lo play as
wellasyou can. There seems little point
in investing large sums of money and
putling the name ofyourband in fiontof
an audience and critical adjudicalors to
nol give yourverybestand learnasmuch
as Possible from the experience.

8. Use clinicians. Seek outside help in
preparation- New obieclivily is a marvel
ooslhing in preparin g fo I such an impoF
tant event. Seeklhe collective wisdom
ol other experienced brass band con-
ductorswho can give you an honesl and
crilically consiructiveopinion about how
Yout band is Drogressrng

I Pract ice hard and havefunlWhen you

arrive at the competition, participate.
Listen to as many of the solo and en-
semble competitions. Eetler still, lake
part. Listen lo as many bands as you
can- Go to clinics. Play in the Reading
Band and check oul the percussion
equipment and the acoustics. Typically
a one-hour final rehea rsal for ih€ band is
scheduled during the Friday evening of
the compelition weekend. Be prepared
for limiled percussion during lhis time.
l\Ieetfriends in the bar orrestau€nt and
yoLt will flnd a wonderfu I su ppod meche-
nism for yout brass band. Get more
involved in NABBA Be sure your band
has a repr€sentative on th€ NABBA
8oard. Enjoy theweekend, lhe results,
the hard wo* of the hosts, lhe Gala
Concert and use lheevenl to lift, broaden
and enlighlen lhe membership of your
brass band. Win or not win (no-one
loses when they prepare in the corecl
fashion and us€ the competilion notas a
means unto itself but as a growlh tool),
you'll undersland why bands and their
members come back year after year to
compele and play for each other.

10. The adjudication syslem: few mal-
lerc gamer rnore criticism in brass band
presses eround lheworld more than lhe
syslems of adjudication. Here we utilize
the following system Three judges
adjudicate each sect ion Thejudges do
not confer The judges listen lo lhe
performances "blind The judges are
required to provide both taped and writ-
ten criticisms olthe pedomances Their
scores arc simply added up at the con-
clusion of each pedormanceand places
are awarded on the ment of lhe most
number of poinls Presenlly lhe scores
are weighted 607o for test-pieces and
40% for own choice materials Poinls
are deducted for perlorming both under
oroverlheal lot led amountof t ime. The
winnersare lraditionally announced duF
ing the evening Gala Concert

continued on page 24
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11. Planning a rehoersa I  schedule: con-
ductors have lo balance the musical
needs ofthe band between theircompe-
tition preparations and olher concert
engagements leading up to NABBA. I
lhink that most if not allbands add exka
rehearsals to their schedule as part of
the preparations. lvly experience has
been fo include a weekend "kick-off'
€ventin January (Thursday night, Friday
night,  al lday Salurday) and then add an
extra Saturday morning rehearsal every
other week leading up lo the compeli,
l ion. Saturdaymorningrehearsalshave
lypically been much more produclive
than Thursday evening rehearsals. l've
utilized sectionals and clinicians. I've
programmed NABEA competilion mu-
sic as often as possible in concerls
leading up lo and following the event.

1 2. I\rany bands use lheir performances
tor recordings. lt's usually a highlighl of
the perlormance calendar and lhere's a
good audienceon hand losupportevery-
one. The qualily of lhe recordings has
generally been good.

13 Many bands use lheir awards and
placemenis as parl of grant applica-
tions. ltcould be possibleforevery band
entering the competition to stale lhal
they are one of the top twenty brass
bands in North America, regardLess of
where lhey place.

EXPLORER, OPEN, YOUTH AND
CHALLENGESECTIONS
Reviewed by Bed Wiley

OnApri l '13, lhad lhe dist inct pr iv i legeot
announongforand l isteningto, the bands
that played their compelition programs
in lhe Bal l room ofthe Raddison Holel  in
Cincinnati The excitemenl was evident
as the flrst band appeared for pedor-
mance, supported by a large numberot
family an d friends; th is excitement lasted
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throughout the day, even though the
audience size varied greatly.

The categories included in th is part of the
competition included Explorer, Youth,
Open and Challeng€. ltwas unfodunate
forlhetrue sense of compelition thatthe
Explorer and Open only had one com-
petitor each. lt js our ardent hope lhat
lhis will change as the brass band move-
m€nl continues lo grow,

The firct band to perform, an Explorcr,
was conducled by Keilh Wilkinson; lhe
band was lhe Varsity All€tar Brass
Band from lhe Coiumbus, OH commu-
nity This group consisls ol students
Irom grades nine lhrough twelve; lherr
requited test piece was Sinfoniefta for
8,'sss Bard by Joseph Horovitz. The
band playsd wilh greal certainty and
excellentpreparalion and was cond!cted
with ski l landtremendousconsiderat ion
fordelai l .

The Youth bands were from Ohio (Jun-
ior Va6ity All-Star grass Band) and
lhe Trlangle Youth Bra6s Band from
Raleigh, Norlh Carolina. Both bands
p ayed lhe Pollto S.//e de Ba e! by Eric
Ball, and both played exlremely well
One of the interesting features of the
enlife day was to wilness the conslanl
changes in the sel  up of lhe band charrs
and stands The changes were interesl-
ing and sometimes amusing as chairs,
stands and percussion equipment was
located and relocaled throughout ihe
dey.

The Sy.acuse University Brass En-
semble was lhe only band in the Open
secl ion andwere members of thefacul iy
of Su and surrounding regions in up-
state New York The open section tesi
piece was the Conce,'1ante by Slephen
Eulla and lhe band played this in a tight
and mean;ngfulway.

The nen live bands were in the Chal-
lenge Seciion also performing the re-

quired test piece, Concedante. As an
intenl lisleneril was mosl fascinating lo
quickly become aware ofthe diversity ol
interpretation as well as the placement
ofcertain seclions ofthe bands, padicu-
la y the comets and lrombones. The
repetition of the test piece made for a
most anteresling davercity of sound as
well as interprelalion. The bands all
played exkemely w6ll, both as they
played lhe test piece, bul also in lherr
choices of repertoire lo complete lheir
prcg€ms.

As a long time member of NABBA and
wilh tremendous inlerestin b€ssbands
I am proud of lhe accomplishments of
each band, regardless ot sectaon and
regardless of lhe greatvar iety of playing
ab l i t ies. l found thisto b€ a day ofgreal
pleasure asthe emcee and as a listenel

Results:
Exolorer: 1. Va6ltyAll-Star Band 251 6
Youlh: 1. T.iangle Youth Brass Band
281; 2. Junior VaBity Al l -Star Brass
Band 262.8
Chal lenoer 1. Sunahln€ Brass Band
278 2. Sol ld Bra8s 270.6 3 Common-
wealth Bra$ Band 262.2 4. Spires
Brass Band 253.4 5. Erass Band ottho
Tri-State 251 6
Ooen Syracuse Unlversity Brass En-
s6mble 260.4
Ben Wiley is the NABBA Execuuve

HONORS SECTION
Reviewed by Li1utenanl Colonel Tho-

The Princeton High Schoolauditorium rr
S haronville, OH offered a wonderful venue
Ior lhe Honors and Champlonship sec-
t ions ofthe North American Brass Banc
Association's annual competition. The
acoustics were excellent, and the judges
would getan accurate listen tothebands
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compeling that day. The adjudication
panelwas one of lhe most dist inguished
in lhebrass bandworldt Geoffrey Brand,
James Cumow, and Frank Renton brought
many decades of wodd-class experi-
ence to lhe evenl. I was privaleged to
se e as compere for the venue and
jotled down my observalions as lhe day
wore on. In some cases, I had to leave
the hall lo attend to other business so
some bands' notes are less exlensive
lhan olhers.

The test piece for the Honors Section,
Joseph Horovitz's Balet forBand would
provide a real challenge for the fou.
bands in lhat section. Th€firstlo tackle
the lest was the Pralrlo Brass Band
(Dallas Niermeyer). Niermoyerwas out-
wardly quite relaxed and did his best to
settle his band as they took lhe stage,
knowing lhat the early hour and a num-
berone drawwere not ideal The band
launched into the tesl piece with great
spirit and a wonderful tutti sound. The
piece'stort!rous exposed lines were nol
al l  wel l  handled, something thal  would
plague every band in this seclion. Al-
though therewas a bi lof  lossofrhythmic
focus, the band survived lhe "lesl" an
overall good fashion. Prairie's choice
piece was the lormidable year of lhe
Dr€gon and lhe band was clearly com-
fortable with this piece While exposed
passeges slill proved problematic, the
band's tutti sound showed fine balance
and characler Prairie set a high stan-
dard forthe other bands to overcome, bul
did notreal ly nai l i t tothewal land had lef l
roomforothers lo lake homethe banner.

Next upwaslhe lllotor City Erass Band
(Craig Slrain).  This band has shown
sleady improvement each year and
seemed confidenl as they took the stage
showing their years of experience In
NABBA compelitaons. Strain had cho-
sen to go with a fullend varied program
ratherlhan performing two "tesl" pieces.

The bandopenedwith Prccession of the
Nob/es. Despite some pitch ineccu-
racy, particularly in the muted sections,
the band handled the piece well and
!sed it to seltle themselves. Next was
theteslpiece. MotorCity also had some
difficultieswith the exposed seclions but
I was apparenl lhe band enjoys the
piece and you could feel lhem gaining
conl idence and momenlum as they
played, finishing strongly. Nexl was
E/sa's Processio, and lvotor City pro-
vided some tru ly movrng momenls. There
was one crescendo/rallenlando lhal was
so perfectlyplayed I nearly gasped. This
groups music making was really im-
pressive and showedyears of groMh as
an €nsemble. MCBB closed iheir pro-
gram with P.alse, a r€al cheslnul lhal
deserves mo re freq uenl performance, Al
lhis point, I was nol sure which one of
lhese bands was in lhe forefront but
believed lhey would both bestrongcom-
pelitors lor lhe banner.

The Central Ohio Brass Band (Tony
Zilincrk)came next and lhe cont.ast in
trmbres was slaiking This band wenl
after the test piece displaying a fat end
powerful low brass sound, a very lrum-
pellike cornet quahty, and a bit thin jn

the middle. Their reading was confidenl
and aggressive but I wondered how the
"trumpely" soundwould go overwilh the
judges They fol lowed with Phi l ip
Sparke's Mounlan Song, presenling an
enchanl ing and elherealopen ng with a
wonderful muted euphonium solo. Whi e
lhe soundega|nwas a bi takin lofanfare
lrumpets at higher dynamic levels, the
bandclearly has an effinilyforthis piece.
COBB closed their set wth Les Gulsks
(Jean Bal issai)  Rhythmrca ly clean and
forceful, t played to lhe r skengih - this
band ikes lo rock Af ine and enter lain-
ing pedormancebul probably acking lhe
poi ish and blend i lwould lakelo capture
the banner in this secl ion

The A// StarErass & Percussion balted
clean-up rn the Honors Sect ion and

started wilh Ray Steadman-Allen's Ser-
vice Above Self. Displaying a muscular
sound and a powerfu I low brass section,
the band also had a different tuning
temperament than some of the other
bands. Wth a bit ofvibralo and a wider
pilch center, it sounded a bit like some
ofihe 1950s era brass band recordings
in ils trining. The opening march was
rhylhmically sound and dynamically teF
raced bulcould have us€d moreshading
in the dynamics. Th€y followedwilh the
test piece where tempi se€med to lake
a while to really lock in, giving a slightly
fiantic teel. The exposed seclionswere
every bil as t€achercus forlhis band as
for those who weni before. TheAll-Stars
closed their program with The Moor of
V€nic€ (Wlliam Alwyn). ltwasn'tappaF
ent that their choice selections would
really help lhe band ov€rcome some of
the difficullies with lhe t€sl piece. As
th€ir set went on, lhe band seemed to
weardown and lfinished listening wish-
ing they had perhaps competod in lhe
Chailenge Seclion where this lalenled
young band would be beltermatched lo
both lhe music and the compelition.

Exce llent perforrnances and aggressive
choice programming marked lhis yea/s
Honors Section. The test piece left no
band "unscar.ed" and lruly gave the
judgesoppodunitieslo heareach band's
strengths and weeknesses. As ihe
sect ion f in ished, my notes ref lect I
thought the bands would f in ish in the
orderof play (Prair ie,  MolorCity,  COBB,
All Stars). However, none of the bands
had really nailed lheir program so the
order could easily be jumbled. As it
turned out, the scores were extremely

Resul ls:
1 Prairie Brass Band 260.6 2. Motor
City Brass Band 248 8 3. Cent.alOhio
Brass Band 248 6 4. All Sta. Brass
and Percussion 237

conlinued on page 26
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CHAMPIONSHIP SECTION

The 2002 Championship Section would
feature erght bands, many with impres-
sive credentials and some with new
personnel.  First  up was the Cuyahoga
Val ley Brass Band with Dr.  Keith
Wlkinson atthe helm (orhis clone, as r t
seemed Keilh was nearly everywherel).
They jumped right into the test piece,
Philip Sparke's Cambidge Vaiatians.
The band had a nicely realized inlerpre-
tation andwas energetic in its approach.
Some troublesome solo l ines and the
inir icale innerparlswould leave plentyof
room for others to jump ahead. Their
reading of Peler Graham's Esserce of
Itme was quite effeclive The band
seemed togel lheirsecondwind and had
calmed a brt .  Overal l  i twasa respect '
ab eshowing, but CVBB would probably
not be al the lop ofthe seclion at lhe end
of the day.

Perennial  powerhouse l l l inoi6 Brass
Band was nexl wilh a new conductof,
Peier Lipari. His bio reflects mostly
orcheslral experience and his conducl-
ing slye showed it - extremely ener-
getic, expresslve, and in a style unlike
many ofthe olhers Theband launched
inio lhe lest prece and ihey were stun-
ning and powerful, and yet polished.
Theirteslp ece Monlreaux Wind Dances
d spiayed not only technical artistry but
a so an extremely defl rendering oftex
lures and shaping. IBB did not seem to
my ears to have quitethe rawpowerand
energy lhey have shown in ihe past, bui
had a bi t  mofe shape and subt letes in
the r Ines. Anyway i t  was clear this
would be the band to beat on this day.

Anoiher NABBA sialwart, lhe Eastern
lowa Brass Band took the stage next,
alsowith a newconductor,  Tom Nelson,
a former member of lhe band. Starling
wilh Canbidge Yar'alions, the band
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displayed their  t rademark honeyed
sound. However,  at  higher dynamc
levels when the lrombones and cornets
''stepped on the gas," lhe other seciions
d dn tqu te balanceandtheband'ssound
got lhin and br ighl .  EIBB gave a f ine
readlng of the test piece but disp ayed
flaws in some of lhe exposed sections.
They followed wth Conrolatlors and
struggleda bi tw ththetreacherousopen-
ing. Thiswasasol id reading butnoth ng
thatwould vault  them into the upper t ier.
Frankly, I was sorry to see EIBB join the
growing €nks of " two tesl  piece'bands.
Their reading of marches was always a
highl ight for me and had played wel l to
their  strengths polshed sound good
ensemble play ng and nuanced dynam-
ics.

All-StarStaff Brass Band was nextand
opened with C!rnows Fanfare Prelude.
A good sierter for lhem, lt was rhythmi-
cally ught, had a solid pitch center, and
waswel l  played. Thiswasa good chojce
to get the band setled in but probably
wouldn' t  garner lhem many points be-
cause of lhe moderate difficulty of the
piece. Their feading of ihe tesi piece
showed them fa ling into some of the
same lraps astheoihers in theexposed
sect ions. Whi le ihe band held f i rm, they
just ddn' t  have lhe depth ln lhe soo
chairs to pu I this off. The Al-Siar Staff
Brass Eand closed wth Sh/ne as ihe
L,ghl (Peier Graham), a fun prece well
played. The band did not quite perform
ihe del lcaie lechnical  passages but
cosed wlth a rousing and qui le inspira-
i ionalf in sh Boih this band andtheAl l
SiarBrass Band are much improved over
last yearwilh betlef pilch and mofe firm
lechnique. I  couldn' t  help feel ing how-
ever ihat both bands were playing one
sect ion higher lhan they should

Keilh Wilkinson returned with the St.
Louis Brass Band and opened with
Resu,gam. The band was resplendent in
new scarlet gold-lrimmed tunics and
their  reading ofthe Eric Bal l  c lassic was

proper but did not bring out the deec
emotionalism of this piece. As each c/
the judges would probably have strcn_.
feelings about Resurgam, I expecled the
vani l la rendi l ion would hurt  the band r
the scoring. SLBB's test piecewas fi.€
but seemed to be a few woodsheddini
sessions away from making a run atfi
banner.  SLBB has come a long way r
a short time but 2002 didn'l seem to b.
lheir  year.

An a ir of q uiel confidence su nounded ll'€
Brass Band ofColumbus as they loo.
the stage. Veteran conductor Dr Pa,
Droste appeared to be relaxed wh:€
lounging in a chair  in the wings as t f 'e
band set-!p crewworked and il seemea
this o d warhorse was looking forward :.
the race. BBC opened with Lesle
Condon s Ca/ebralion lf I could have
wou d have given lhem the bannerrg;:
lhen''glorious, well paced, nicelyshapec
justthewaythis march should be playe.
BBC'S test piece did nol seem lo me r.
beescleanly play6das IBB's butshowe:
slrong solo work and a superb inlerpre.
iation. They closed with F/ourish an:
Darces (Kevin Norbury). A cute prece
it  let  BBC showtheirabi l i iy to go from l l 'e
l i g h t e s t  d e l i c a t o  t o  a  l h u n d e n . !
fort issimo Regardingtheirstand ngvrs-
a-vls IBB my contemporaneous noles
say "tooclosetocal l ."  lhad no idea ho.
prophet ic that would bel

Atlantic Brass Band (Salvatore Scarpa
openedwith lhe Day Thou Gavesl(Ph Li.
Wiby) Foliowing the test piece, lhe,
gave us Symphany ofThanksgiving (Dea'
Goffin) Throughout their performan.E
they pushed the edge in lempi. In tf€
spectrum between classical and toma-
i ic approaches, this band is alwaysfar: :
the romantic end. Frankly, I love |lste'
inglo them and lovewatching Scarpa e
work. Their approach will p roba bly nev€.
b ng them home a banner because ia

continued on page 2'



continued from page 26

band feels free to "freelance' a bit with
their  approach lo the music.  An excel-
lent band, I  didn' t  feel  they had the
attention to delailto win the section but
really hopetheycontinuetobring NABBA
lheirinteresling and adventuresome ap-
proaches lo the music.  Whi le at t  mes
unconventional, their musical approach
is always listenable entertainlng, and
thoughtprcvoking.

Prior lo the entry ofthe CentralFlor ida
Brass Band to the stage, lhe audience
was introduced to a ficllonal Band #8
wilh membersfrom IBB and EIBB threaf
ening to combine "Erassed Off 'wi lh
"The Ful lMonty" inwhatmight be termed
ihe only entry of the weekend for the
Exhibition Section (you had to be there
to appreciale lhisl). CFBB were greBt
sporis about i l  and they soon aunched
inlo a stifiing rendition ofthe test piece.
They 6nded with Kevin Norbury's dra-
matic Odyss€y with Michael Garasi at
the helm in his f i rst  NABBA appearance.
Their tesi piece reading was not quite
ready for top-f l ight competi i ion and
seemed tight and neruous As the pro-
gram went on, Garasi  and the band
seemed to forget about the judges and
just played, and the effeci was notice-
able. CFBB isaf inebandandw th more
experience lhey coud contend {or a
banner

Ai the end ofthe day, the Controller staff
was alertedthatal le had occurred in ihe
ChampionshipSect ion Referral ioihe
NABBA Contest Rules cal led for ihe
winnerto be delermined by the score on
lhe lest piece -- also a tiel lt would be
patently unfair (and not supported by
NABBAS By-Laws) to concoct sorne
lype of additional tiebreaker on the spol
--- Contest Rules are approved by a
majority vote of lhe Board of Directors
Accord ngiy boih IBB and BBC were
declafed wrnners of ihe Championship
Sect ion --  a truly Solomon-i ike out-

come. The odds of this occurring, with
totally independentjudges andweighted
scorif g (60/40) are astronomical a nd left
all of us surprised. Lest anyone think
there was any oppodunity forjudges to
confer, ei me put that to rest as I was
wilh thejudges the ent ire t ime they were
' 'out of  lhe box" As each band per-
formed, the judges completed their sco F
ng and lurned the sheets in enclosed in
a sealed envelope. Even during their
breaks, ludges were accompanied and
barred from discussing the cornpelition,
which lhey adhered to scrupulously.
After recalling the two bands'perfor
mances, r t  was apparent to me and
reflected in my noles, that there really
were two legitimate championsl well
played and wel learnedl

Most encouraging in this yea/s compe-
tition was the conlinued good sports-
manship and fel lowship displayed at
everytuln. When a band hadlurned in a
particu arly fine performance, it was nol
uncornmon iorthe a!dience, comp sed
moslly of their competitors, io leap to
lhe rieei n ovation This was nol llm ted
to ihe winnng pe.formances but oc-
curred wheneverthe aud ence fel t  lhere
had been some mL.isical magrc. In the
wngs, I saw several players fingering
parlsalongwjthacompeti iors bandand
commenting " ihal 's better lhan I 've ever
played il " when a particularly good ren-
dition was offered. Th at apprecialion for
good music and musicianship and sin-
cere affection for each other is what
makes NABBA speclal .

Final ly,  the hosi C ncinnai i  Brass Band
set the standard for future hosts. l\le
ticu lous pian n ing, friendly efficiency and
at ienl ion to detai lgave us al lawonderful
experience. DwighlWagesandhisstaff
puton a terrific show NABBA President
Ani ia Hunt should be very proud and
peased wi ih her frs l  conlesl  as Presi-
dent as I was ab e lo discover what is
perhaps lhe best lob ln NABBA; Pasl
Presideni.

Results:
1. B.ass Band of Columbus and lhe
l l l inois Brass Band 281.4 3. Brass
Band of Central  Flor ida 276.6 4. St
Louis Bress Band 266.6 5. Atlantic
Brass Band 265.2 6. Eastem lowa
Brass Band 261.4 7. Cuyahoga Val ley
Brass Band 256.8 8. All-Star Staff
Brass Band 241
Lieutenant Calonel Thomas H. Palma er
is a Past-Presidenl of NABBA.

GALACONCERT
Reviewed by Ralph Hotz, Peler Cooper
and Ed Carroll

Recipe for S uccess: Bring together some
of lhe finest musician from the United
States, augmenl them with Slephen
lvlead and Co. Ircm the UK, bring in
HowardSnel land Sam Palaf ian, andyou
havea recipefora stunningly successf!l
Gala Con6erl .  This is whatwas heard at
lheannualGalaConcertat lheTi-Co!nty
Assembly of God Church Al lhough al l
n attendance suffered from lhe soaring
iemperalures in lhe hal l  the musicians
prevailed on stage by providingiheirown
brand and sty e of heat. Howard Snell
led wth a conducl ing style that was
reseNed wiih a clear style and beat.
Devoid of L.innecessary movements, he
was able to convey the ful lness of the
mlsjc, especially 1n Harmony Music
(Phi l ip Sparke).  [ , , lany of ihe musicians
on slage probably had neverp ayed this
stalwart blass band competition p ece.
\rulth limited rehearsal, Harmony Music
highlighted lhe serious f/rst part of an
extreme y entertaining concert.

Thespotlightof the{itsl half of the evenlng's
program was a stunning rendit ion, by
Steven Mead of Napo/i. Mead's eupho-
nium p aying displayed technlque that
was as masierf!l as has ever shown in
the iamous cornei solo. The speed of
Napol rnay have been a b t excessive,

continued on Page 28
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butnoone could argue with the clarity of
both lhe tonguing and flexibillty thal
Steven exhibited.

Possibly the highl ight of the evening in
an evening lhat had so many highlights,
was lhe demonslration of lrom bon e vidu-
osity by Wycliffe Gordon while playing
El l ington's 8/ack and Tan Fanlasy.
Gordon's abiliiy to make his trombone
speak wrth many inflections broughl a
greal roar of approval, awe and accep-
tance from the audience.

Sam Palafian's understandingof the jazz
idiom, and his abi l i ty to convey his de-
sires added lo lhe mix of the evening.
His a rlfu I a rrangerienl brou ght life to one
of Ellington's eady hils There is no
brass band in lhe wodd lhat has the
abilily to swing with lhe style of Batlle
Creek Brass Band. And it is not the
easiest project to entertain an audience
already salurated and sated af lera long
day of repelitious competition and con-
lest ing lension, bLrt  Bat i le Creek suc-
ceeded with a goumetfeast of  uniquely
presented and played brass band mu-
sic.

Conductor Sneli began the second hall
of the band's concertwith his own won
dedul arra n gement of timeless Cole Po F
ler tunes. The audlence roared i ts ap-
proval when ihe band portrayed bolh a
broken recordand aVictrolawho'sspnng
had wound down. Freshness and fun at
ii's bestl

Blue Bellsof Scotlandis, as was po nted
out, at lhe concert, lhe lrombonists
"Carnival of Venice." l\Iany have tried
and many havefai led buton this part icu-
larevening i twas a slam-dunk for so oist
Aain Trudel. You cannot spend a life-
l ime around banding withoul hearing
many pedormances of lhis evergreen but
it may only be once that you hear ii
played with the virtuosily of this young

28 The Brass Band Bridge June2002

Canadian musrcian. His f lu id technique,
sound, humor and the stunning tempo
wth which he played the final varration
wrli be remembered by all who attended
for many, many years.

Some music is so soothing i t  bel ies the
art stry that musl be presenttocreate it.
Such were the quiet moments of our
eveningwith lhe Batt leCreek ensemble
Bolh I'm Getting Senlimental Ovet You
and Cancierto de Aranjuez werc truly
welcomemomenisof respi ie in lhewhir l -
wind that was NABBA XX. Both the
lrombone quartet and flugel soloist Tim
l\,4orrison made us rememberthat e few
well placed notes can speak to our
emol ions inways that the mosl wonder-
ful  lechnique can never do.

GLrest conducior Dr. Paul Droste led lhe
band n a spiriled rendrt on ofihe C/rcus
Bee March ll aryoneexpecled the iempo
io beon theconserval ivesidebecauseof
the band s invtat ion lo nclude three of
NABBA's youth banders lhey were cer-
iainly siunned at ihe downbeat.  Many a
band may attemptlhisbreaknecktempo.
Few wi l  succeed with lhe clar i ty and
dynamic contrastheard on ihis nightand
if  f lngers don' t  l ie. . . . . lhose young guests
had no trouble keep ng up, Bravo io our
fliure stars and lo Batue Creek for pro-
vding such a memorable momenl for

The even ng concluded wilh a last taste
of the style lhal  has made ihis band
famous. Balile Creek proved once and
for al-Brass Bands can swingi The
closer was ihe t t  e number from iheif
first CD and it was a feal lreat to hear
S/ng Sing S/rg in live performance. Per-
cussion st Mke Gould, quiei ly in ihe
background throughout ihe evening put
his personal stamp on night with his
highly creaiive solo. ltwas a very filting
punctuation with which to close out a
great concert and NABBA Champion
ship. A flnal thanks to Battle Creek ior
drawing the three days togelher with

such gfeat programing and ariistryl

Ralph Holz is a tenor hom player Ar
Utah Premier Brass, NABBA Baa-
Membet and Adveftising Manget fot tbe
Brcss Band Bridge; Pete Cooperand E.
Cafioll arc nembers af the Las Vegat
Brass Band.

JUDGE'S COMMENTARIES

li was obvious from the firsl conlact $_:
John de Salme lhat NABBA XX was r
good hands. Contact and instructto't
werc clearand unambiguous and evel
thing fell into place as lhe competrlrr'
approached. The weekend itseif v,?.
most interesting es pecia lly fot someo't
more usedlo brass band compel I  ons .
ihe Brt ish ls les. Your cr i ter ia for adlLl
cat ion are much more formal,  m--
clearcrand, I  be|eve, inlheendiarre' : :
everyone concerned; lhat can only 5a
good.

At besl, the performances I heard we'.
veryvery good andwould standcomPa-
son with bands of a simi lar s latus a.,
where in ihe world. Farther down ea-
section the problems seemed to be Lesr
iech n ical bul more concerned wth .::.
nat on and theabi l i ty toaclua ly pedc-
in an outgoing and convincing rnanne'
That doesn't  mean lust play louder : t
about the overall shape of the firusc
chosen and lhe impression i tcreales'J '
ihe l is lener.

Thewholeweekend wasworthwhtle titP
com pelition s seemed to be played o!l .
a fair and genuine aimosphere and rt
other attractions, concerts and exhit>
tions worked really weli. All in all I thrft
a good time was had by all concerne:
Thank you.

continued on Page !:



CHAMPIONSHIP SECTION

1983 Smoky l\rountain E tish Brass Band (Richard Trevadhen)
1984 Gramercy British Brass of NY (John Lambert Jnr)
'1985 Gramercy British Brass of NY (John Lambert Jnr)
1986 Brass Band of Columbus (Paul Droste)
1987 Brass Band of Columbus (Paul Droste)
1988 Brass Band of Columbls (Paul Droste)
1989 WRAL Brit ish Brass Band (Jack Stamp)
'1990 Brass Band of Columbus (Paul Droste)
1991 Brass Band of Columbus (Paul Droste)
1992 Ohio Collegiate Brass (Les Susi/Paul Droste)
1993 Brass Band of Columbus (Paul Drosle)
1994 Hawthorne City Bress Band (Ken l\racDonald)
1995 Erass Band of Columbus (Paul Drosie)
1996 l l l inois Brass Band (Colin Holman)
1997 l l l inois Brass Band (Colin Holman)
1998 l l l inois Bress Band (Colin Holman)
1999 Brass Eand of Collmbus (Paul Drosie)
2000 l l l inois Brass Band (Colin Holman)
2001 l l l inois Brass Band (Colin Holman)
2002 Brass Eand of Columbus (Paul Drosto) and

lllinois Brass Band (Peter Lipari)

HONORS SECTION

Testpiece

Sinfonielta in Three Movements (Gordon Langford)
E le.fafimerls (Gilbert Vinter)
Ykcaya (Gilbert Vinter)
Ballet for Band (Jaseph Horovitd)
Connofaliors (Edward Gregson)
Sy nphon y of M arch e s \Gilbert Vinter)
P/antagenels (Edward Gregson)
lntroduction, Elegy and Captbe (Morley Calved)
,Aspecls of Praise (Wlliam Himes)
'Connolalions (Edward Gregson)
.F/restoml (Stephen Bulla)
Vanations for Brass Band (Ralph Vaughan Wlliams)
The Essence of Time lPeter Graham)
Trltlco (James Curnow)
7he New Jerusa/em (Philip Wlby)
Cortesl Music (Heaton)
/saiah 40(Redhead)
Whitsun Wak6s lgallJ
Mastets of Space and Time (Broughton)

Can bidge V a iation s lspatkeJ

Ll{/e Sullo tor Brass (lvlalcolrn Arnold)
A Suite lor Swilz1dand lRoy Newsome)
t e Shhbui/doB (P6ter Yorke)
A Barchesler Suila lDetek Bougeois)
Hinemoa (Garelh Wood)
Trilogy for Brass Band lJoseph Turin)
A Moor.s/de Srlte (Gustav Holsl)
Vaiations on "Tena Boaia"(James Curnow)
Carflb/es ,i|) Brass (Stephen Bulla)
'Pagearty (Herbert Howells)
"Aspects of Praise (Himes)
Laude(Curnow)
Toumament fot Bmss l9zll,
Diversions on a Bass Theme (Lloyd)
Endeavour lsperke)
Purcel I Vai ation s lKennelh Downie)
Sinfanietta (Leidzen)
Music for the Common Man (Dolrnie,
A London Ovefture lspa*e)
Ballet for Band lHoroviv)

1983
1984
1985
1986
1987
1988
1989
1990
1991
1992
1993
1994
1995
1996
1997
1998
199S
2000
2001
2002

NCSU British Brass Band (Perry Watson)
Sunshine Brass (Don Kneeburg)
Sunshine Brass (Don Kneeburg)
Sunshine Brass (Don Kneeburg)
WRAL Brilish Erass Band (Oavid Reed)
WRAL British Brass Band (Jack Stamp)
Eastern lowa Brass Band {Steve Wrighl)
Eastern lowa Brass Band (Al Slang)
Ohio Collegiate Brass (Jon Woods/Paul oroste)
Eastem lowa Brass Band (John de Salme)
Sheldon Theatre Brass Band (W Larry Brentzel)
l l l inois Brass Band (col in HoLman)
Eastern lowa B|ass Band {John de Salme)
Dominion Brass Band (Thomas Palmatier)
Eastern lowa B|ass Band (John de Salme)
All-Star Brass and Percussion (Eric Aho)
Cincinnati Brass Band (Anita Cocker Hunl)
Cincinnati Brass Band (Anita Cocker Hunl)
St Louis Brass Band {Keilh Wlkinson)
Prairie Brass Band (Dallas Nie|meyer)
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CHALLENGE SECTION

1986 NCSU British Erass Band (Perry Watson)
1987 Eastern lowa Brass Band (Sleve Wright)
1988 NCSU British Brass Band (Perry Watson)
'1989 NCSU British Brass Band (Perry Watson)
1990 Ohio Collegiale B€ss (Joel P!gh)
1991 Milwaukee British Brass Band (Wayne Eecker)
1992 Varsity All-Star Brass Band (Eric Aho)
1993 Varsity All-Star Brass Band (Eric Aho)
1994 '...*""no entries
'1995 Buffalo Silver Band {Michael Russo)
1996 Cincinnati Brass Band (Anita Cocker Hunt)
1997 Cincinnati Brass Band (Anita Cocker Hunt)
1998 Prair ie Brass Band (Dallas Niermeyef)
1999 St Louis Brass Band (Malcolm lvlcDuffee)
2000 Sunshine Brass Band {Jim Cheyne)
2001 Spires Brass Band (John Slezak)
2002 Slnshine Brass Band (Jim Cheyne)

Lllfle Su,le tor Erass (Arnold)
A Malvem Suile (Sparke)
Three Hawoih lmpressiors (Langford)
Cllyscapes (Bulla)
Su/le ir' E flal (Jacob)
Patlfa (Gregson)
A Downlard Sulte (lreland)
Th re e H awotth I m p re ssions (Langf ord)

Panib for aand (l/l.lby)
Chorcle and Toccata (Bulla)
Ameic a n Vaiatio n s (F e.nie)

A Moorslde Sulle (Holst)
Sympho,lc Sulie (Lucas)
Rhapsody ln Erass (Goffin)
Concertante (B!lla)

'testpiece selected from a lisl of choice.

Charale and Toccala (Slephen Bulla)
Aneican vaiations lAlan Fe'nie)

OPEN SECTION

1996 Woods Manufacturing Brass Band (David Druce)
1997 Northwinds Erltish Brass Band ([,li]ton Potter)
1998 tt 'no ontries
1999 t"no entries
2000 'ttno entries
2001 Syracuse University Brass Ensemble (James Spencer)
2002 Syracuse University Brass Ensemble (James Spencer)

YOUTH SECTION

1987 Varsily All-Star Brass Band (Eric Aho)
1988 Varsity AII-Star Brass Band (Eric Aho)
1989 "'no entries
1990 Varsity Allstar Brass Band (Eric Aho)
1991 Varsity Allstar Brass Band (Eric Aho)
1992 Junior Varsily All-Star Brass Band (Eric Aho)
1993 Junior Va6ity All-Stars (Eric Aho)
1994 Junior Varsity All-Stars (Eric Aho)
1995 Junior Varsity All-Stars (Eric Aho)
1996 Junior Varsity Allstars (Eric Aho)
1997 Junior Varsity All-Stars (Eric Aho)
1998 Junior Varsity All-Stars (Ken Mccoy)
1999 Junior Varsity All-Stars (Eric Aho)
2000 Junior Varsity All-Stars (Eric Aho)
2001 T engle Youlh Brass Band (Tony Granados)
2002 Trlangle Youth Brass Band,(Tony Granados)
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Music lot Grcenwich lEdward Gregson)
Appalachian Mauntain Folk Sorg Saie (James Curnow)

Erglrsh Counl4l Sceres (Eric Eall)
Petite Suite de Balet (Etic Ball)
Wheailards (Bram Wiggins)
L/tfle Sur'te /or Erass (Malcolm Arnold)
D iv eiimento lEtic BallJ
Legend n Erass (James Curnow)
Suite from Kanlan lKenneth Downie)
Key West (Danoll Batry)
T he J ou rney n e n (Ray Sieadman-Allen)
Legerd m Brass(Curnow)
Diogenes(DeHaan)
The Seasons (Wlby)
Petite Suile de Ballet lgall)

Rhapsody /, Srass (Gofiln)
Cancetlanle lBulla)



EXPLORERSECTION

2001 Varsi ty Al l -Slars (Keith Wikinson)
2002 Varsi ly Al l -Stars (Keith Wikinson)

Ihe Seasons (Wilby)
S i n f o n i ett a lH ot ov ilz)

SOLO AWARDS

1983 Ann Buckner (cornet),  Smoky Mountain Brass Band
1984 Ron Wil l iams (euphonium), Weslon Si lver Eand
1985 Kris Dahl in (soprano cornet) Bloomington Brass Band
1986 l \ , , larc Gordon (euphon urn),  Sunshine Brass
1987 James ketch (soDrano cornet).  WRAL Bri t ish Brass Band
1988 Robert  T. Snyder Jr ( t rombone), NCSIJ Bri t ish Brass Band
1989 Joan DeHoff (sopGno cornet), Easlern lowa Brass Band
1990 Scott  Healh (euphonium), Ohio Col legiale Brass
1991 Jack Tedrow (euphonium), Sheldon Thealre Brass Band
1992 David Laird (trJba). Atlantic Brass Band
1993 James Frank (sopranom cornei) ,  Al legheny Brass Band
1994 Scott  Heath (euphonium) Ohio Col legate Erass
1995 Julie Vish (soprano cornet), Ohio Collegiate Brass
1996 Adam Wlson (euphonlLrm), Heidelberg Brass Band lYouth Sect ion]

D ana Herak (e!phonium), Central Ohio Brass [Adull Slow ftIelody]
Ni les Dening ( iuba),  Buffalo Siver Band [Adul l  Technical ]

1997 Kevin Baker (tronrbone) lAdull S ow l\relody]
Anthony Zl l  ncik ( tuba),  Central  Ohio Brass Band [Adu t  Technical l

1998 l \ rat t  LaFontaine (euphoniLrm) Al l  Slar Brass and Percussion [Youlh Secl on]
Dennis l\,,londracek (cornet), Eastern lowa Erass Band IAdLrll Slow lMelodyl
Brian Meixner (euphonium), Lexington Brass Band [Adul l  Technical ]

1999 Keith Smilh (cornet),  Al l -Star Brass and Percussion [Youlh Sect ion]
Kevin Cramer (tenor horn) Sunshine Brass Band [Adult S ow Melody]
Amy Nelson (cornet) l l l inois Brass Band [Adult  Technical  Solo]

2000 John Bourne (euphonium), AlLStar Brass and Percussion lYouth Solo]
Amy Nelson (cornet) lllinois Brass Band IAdult S ow [,4elody]
Scott  Heath (euphonium), Brass Eand of Co umbus [Adul i  Technical  Solo]

2001 Andy Stankey (bass irombone), A l-Star Brass and Percussion lYoulh Solo]
Amy Nelson (cornet), | | no s Erass Eand lAdu]t S ow [Ielody]
Guy Clark (cornet),  I  l inois Brass Band [Adult  Technical  Solo]

2002 Dwight King (bass trombone) All-Star Brass and Percussion lYouth Solo]
Bdan Byrne ( i rombone), I  Ino s Brass Band [Adul l  Slow Melody]
Dewie Dowdy (marlmba) Brass Band of the Tri-Slaie IAdult Technical So ol
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ENSEMBLEAWARDS

1997 Ozark Mountains Brass Sextet
1998 All-Star Tuba Quadel lYouth Section]

Four Horsemen Tuba Quartet lAdull Secton]
1999 Fudge and Friends lYouth Brass Ensemble]

Eslamos Enfuego lYouth Percussion Ensemblel
Prairie Brass Band Quintet lAdult Brass Ensemble]

2000 All-Star Brass and Percussion Trornbone Ouartet lYouth Brass Ensemblel
Three Amigos [Youth Percussion Ensemble]
Derby City Tuba Quartet [Adult Brass Ensernble]
Sticks St Loujs [Adult Percussion Ensemble]

2001 Bombaslic Bones [Youlh Brass Ensemblel
Ali-Staf Nlallelt IVen [Youth Percussion Ensemble]
St Louis Brass gand Quartet [Adull Brass Ensemble]
l l l inois Brass Band Percussion [Adul l  Percussion Ensernble]

2002 Four Freaky French Horn Substitutes [Youth Brass Ensembles]
Triangle Youth Percussion lYoulh Percussron Ensembles]
Derby Cily Tuba Quarlel lAdult Erass Ensembles]
SASF Percussion Tio [Adult Percussion Ensemb]el

Reviewed by Ronald Holz

The Reading Band session met Fr iday
evening, 8:45-10 00 p m in Princeton
High School.  Thanks especlal ly to the
Cincinnati Brass Band and severalmem-
bers of lhe Lexingion Brass Band, and
NABBAslaff  wewere ablelo have sol id
nslrumentai ion throughoul the session.
Our conductoF were the sx adjudica-
lors Geoffrey 8rand, James Curnow,
Bram Gregson, Col in Holman. Richard
Holz, Frank Renton, NABBA President
Ani la Hunt,  NABBA ControLler John de
Salme. as welL as yours l ruly.  We were
especially graleful lhal Vincent DjMartino
could be pad of the session as a guest
soloisl. As lhe one session al NABBA
in whrch lhose who don i  play in a com-
petrng band, the reading sessron contin-
uesto beof valuetotheorganizat ion and

ris membershrp

Unless olherwise noled, the instrurnen
lation supphed for each ilem reviewed
below fol lows lradr lLonal Brt ish brass
band scorng irost Er i l ish publ ishers
supply ony treble clef  versions tor al l
pa rls excepl bass kombo ne. I have g LVen
a lechnical level range as follows Very
Easy VE, Easy Ei I\,4oderate M; lrodec
ately Difficult MD; Difficull D; Very Ad-
vanced VA. Addilonal ilems received
trom publishers will be reviewed in up
coming issues as wel las beingfealured
at the upcoming Ashland Brass Band
Fest ivalClnic sessron. Timings are ap-

Whencontacting p!blishers, please men-
tron the B€ss Band Bridge and the
Reading Band Session, tor this keeps

lhe ndustry's Inleresl and suppod

C u r n o w  M u s i c - D s H a s k e  P u b l i c r .
t ions 100 John Sutherland Dr.,  Surte '

Nicholasvr l le,  KY 40356. Tel:  1-80C--
C U R N O W i  E M A i I :  H Y P E R L I I " '
m a r l t o  b s h a w i m s @ n i s  n e
bshawims@mis.net OR HYPERLIN.
m a i l l o : t i m  j i m  s @ m i s  n e '
tinjin's@nis.net Bolh of these p ece:
are recorded on the williams Farr€
recording /mages for 8rass, Ang :

Sh/pslon Prelude (Slephe n Bulla). Leve
I\r. T 3:48. This is a lovely arrangeme"
ofanAnglican hymn lhat Bulla prese.'-!
in ihree contrasting yet complimenta_.
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seltings. Very we I written and effec-
t ively scored piece suitableforal l  sodsof
occasions and lses The piece ends
"big" but not inan overblown style.  Bul la
has done an excellent job n keeping
things in balance throughout the piece
wilh an emphas s on the lyrc This got
lhe Reading Band session off to an
exce llent starti the group so! nd ed g reat

Fanfare and Jubilaso (James Curnow)
Level l \ , ,1D. T 2:41 l fyoulkedCurnows
Fanfare and Flourishes y ou wi I love th is
seq!e to that successful  arrangement
Here the nrain tune comes from the
Renaissance dance composef Timan
Susalo surrounded once agarn by th s
top arrangers original fanfare music.
The l ively dance lune has been used
before in such classics as Del lo Joro's
Scenes lrom "The Lauvre". Ihe piece
does cal l  for some br i l l iant tonguing from
nearly al l  sect ions and you need a sharp
wde awake percuss on sect iont yet i t  is
nol overly dff icul l  lwas p easant ly
surpr ised at howwel l the Reading Band
deall with the piece. I predict greal
populadty with ihis f ine arrangenrenl

The Salvat ion Army - New York, 440
West Nyack Rd,WestNyack NY 10994
Tel: 1 -888-488-4882 of 1 -91 4 -620-7 20o
FAX: 1-914-620-7751. Thesetwo pieces
are part  of  the new Phi l lp Sm ih Signa'
iure Series of the Tr iumphon c Col lec'
t ion. Wewerefortunately lo haveV ncent
Dil\IartLno read ng the so o paris so this
was a rea ly spec a added attraction
especialy after V nce p ay ng so wel l  ai
the Lexington Brass Band concert. Both
thesep ecesare recorded on ihe NYSB/
Phil Smith record ng MySorgsof Sorgs
Triumphonic label.

CornevTrumpei Solo: Standtng on the
Promises (Douglas Courl) Solo Leve
l,f D. Band Level lvl T 4:02. In ihis grace
'r yel energetic Latin style solo the so-
.  st  stafts oui on f lugelhorn and lhen

switches to trumpet. The score callsior
3 percussionists, the most c tical being
a good set p ayer. Court handles the
style wel and scores very well. The
accompanimenl is not at all difficult, so
I lh ink this arrangement of an old gospel
classic wrll be highly altractive to many

Jashua Swings lhe Baltle (Slephen Bula)
So o Level MD Band Level l \ rD. T 2:51
This is a fast.  or n lhe words of the
arranger. "br ghl"swing arfangemenilhal
wi lchal lenge bolh solorst and band, bul
not excessively so. Aclually the Read-
ng Band didverywel l  unt i l  thevery end,

where some ensemble dr i l lwould real ly
be needed. Vince jusl soared over the
band makrng i t  a hghl ight of  the ses-
s on Bul la adapted this sel t ing for Phi l
Smlth, at  his requesl f rom a Kings
Brass recording. Agan, this should
prove an atlractive short program solo
feai! .e for most of our NABBA bands.

Rosehi l l  l l lusic,  PO Box 48, Aylesbury,
HP17 8DW Unlted Kingdom; Tel:  011
44-1494-674-411 emai:  HYPERLINK
m a  l l o  b b @ b t i l i s h b a n d s m a n  c a m
iufa@rcsehillmusic can

Agincoun Sang lElgat Hawarlh/Ray Farr)
Level lM T 2 15 Ray Farr has rescored
Howarth s famous Ph lp Jones Brass
Ensemble sel t ing of this iamous 15th-
century batt le hymn lhat ceebrates lhe
Englrsh and Henry V's victory over lhe
French. We could not real ly play i t  ihe
correct way, for i l  cal ls forthree ant ipho-
na cho rs ofthe br ight nsiruments, two
choirs of cornets, each wth a tenor
daJm, on ihe Rightand the Left ;and then
Trombones standing behind the refirinder
of the band at centerstage. This is a
greal program opener some of ihe
hemiola rhylhms nr ightgive l roubie on a
f i rst  read ng, butgeneral ly this is a very
p ayab e piece, though to do i t  best you
need a learess soprano p ayer

The Salvat ion Army - Toronto, 2

Overlea Blvd. Toronlo. ON Canada [44H
416,425-2111;

I

brian.burdt l@sal lynet.org. This piece
comes from the new lvlaple Leaf Series
ed ted by Kevin Norbury NABBA bands
are encouraged to contact lhe sAToronto
music departmentfor a complete l is l ing
of their  new series.

Ihree /mages (Kevrn Norbury) LevelVA.
T 12100 approx. This lechnicaly de-
manding sui le presents lhree images of
Christ, each in a separale movement:
Christ  Incarnaie Christ  ihe Shephetd;
Christ  Vctor ious. We could only read
the f i rst  movement,  which was qude a
challenge, but filled with lols of inlerest'
ing sounds and beautfuly scored by
Norbury. lmaginauve oiginal mus c marks
each movement but a hymn refefence
alsoappears. l \ rovementl , for instance,
uses the Renaissance Advent chorale
Lo Ere a Rose. This piecewasa siretch
for the Reading Band, thor lgh lhey
seemed to enjoy lhe music. The only
negative complainl received was that
sorne of the parts were quite small, and
therefore a challenging read ng experi-

continued on page 34

Moving or Moved?

e Brass Band Bridgecanno
be forwarded because it is

mailed third class. So, please
be sure to mail to NABBA
ecutive Secretary BertWile

our old and new addresses, o
your copy ofthe Br'dge will be

discarded by the U.S Post
Office, and you will not receive

anyfuture issuesl
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Anglo Music Pres6. PO 8ox 303
Wembley, HAg 8GX England. Emai l :
Phi lsparka@aol.con: Part  of  Phi l ip
Sparke's new Ceremonial Series begun
in 2000. Both pieces are contained on
the Wlliams Fairey recording /mages
Fol Br.ass, Anglo Records

Na y/gelio, /,1r (P h ilip Sparke) Level D T
3:11. A co*er of a concert  march,
Sparke €tes lhis work a grade 5, but I
would say i t  is morea 5.5+! This is one
of lhose great "busy" marches with an
intentionally "relro" fee L Part one sou nds
in F l\rinorwhile the Trio is in D Flat, like
an old Gullidgemarch. The litle refers lo
the band torwhom i twascornmissioned,
Navigal ion Brass ( lan Gibson) |  had
members of rny LBB asking i f lhey could
play rt next year. always a good signl
Thiswould be such fun to play, but i t  wr l l
take hard work.

Ti n e Re nem be rcd (P hilip Sparke) LeveL
ltlD. T 8 26. Sublitled an Elegy for Band.
lhis moderately challenging work was
cornmiss|oned by lhe NSK-RHP Band
to commemorale the r60th anniversary
One of Spa*e's lovely lunes lorms the
basis of lhe moving work. There many
short soli passages throuqhoul dLrring
which most of the prncrpal players are
cal led lo task, but in a lyr ic style This
rs emotronaland expressrve mus c wel l
worlh the effort, and a piece thal would
serve well nol lust al times of remem-
brance. lt does not always stay on the
subdued side; the overallform mighl be
described as a soaring arch. Lovely,
salrsfying music of wide appeal.

Novollo C/o Studlo Music PO Box
19292. London NW10 gWP, England.

*tvd*lviitrivibriitltvCiivlvrrvdddnrvirttllttlY!
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rccatdng Michael Ball, Doyen Record,
ings.

Cambian Suile (l\richael aall); [.{vt 3
Level [rl. I 9:00 approx Here is a
wondedu I moderate-level suite well with n
the reach ofanyofourbands, but espe,
cial ly surtable to Youlh. Explorer,  or
Challenge section bands. There are
lhree movements, each based on a tra-
di l ionalWelsh melody: 1)Men of Harlech
2) Cradle Songi 3) The Ris ng of lhe Lark.
Frank Renton took the Readlng Band
lhrough lhe f inal  movement,  dunng lhe
chmax of whch Bal l  bnngs back the
famous me ody'  Suo gan' (Cradle Song,
from [,4vt 2) just before a scint i la l ]ng
coda that ends n a baze oi  sound
Three aclrve percussron parls added to
ihe score s bf l l l  ance This should prove

R. Smith & Co, Ltd PO Box 367.
Aylesbury, Bucks HP22 4LJ England
Tet Al l  -44-296-682-2 20 i  emai l :
HYPERLI NK mailto:sa/es@rsm ith co. u k
sales@rsmilh.ca.uk

Festival Music lEtic Ball), Mvt 1 Level D
T 12:00 appfox. Thanks to Geoffrey
Bland we were ab e to read this great
classic commissioned as lhe iop level
test piece for the '1956 British Nalional
Brass Band Championships. As we
soon learned, i t  is st i l lqui te alesl  ofany

bandl Bal lwrote thework as atnbu:.E
Mozerl on the occasion of the 23t
centenary of his birlh. We strugg-
through movement one, OVerture, wf ct
has all ihe chromatic pitfalls of a ie
keyboard fanlasia by this great masrt
The middle movemenl takes the foftr t
a heart-felt Romanca and movemert
three is cal led an lmptomptu. Ths a
Eric Ball at his mosl enlightened a!
eegant.  This f lne music deserves I
revival Arethere bandswilling to r skrr
hard work it would take to succeed r
such challenging, yet rewarding mus,:'

Tho Salvat ion Army - London SP3!
1 Tverlon Sheet.  London, SE1 6ff
England O 1 1 -44-207367-6580t er.a'
HYPERLINK .r'aillo Meil_Orde@ S.
S CO UK Mail_Odet@SP-S. CO -.
Both of lhese pieces came to us.
manuscript  draft  mode, pieces desl.+:
for the SA Triumph Series, a med J-
level series scored as follow: Soprar:
First and Second Cornet (No flugelpa_
but i t  can bec!ed in ihe second corn€.
Flrst and Second Horn First and Se:
ond Bariton ei Th ree Trombones, EuF-:.
nium; Two Eassesi Percussion

F atl h f ul God (Chtis Aow aterlDean Jo.?1
Leve E.T2:10. Af ine tone sludy for a-,
band, effeciively scored for smaller e-
semble. bul sounding great for la'g.
bfass band as well Could be us€d ..
any band as a great tone builder T-*
euphonium does soar uptoa h gh B F,a
at forlissrmo level but il is reached r,
sca armotion OlheMise, thisshould r
a slraight foMard piece for any ban0
was unfamil iar with the tune, bul (  u_
folds like a slow contemporary ChnstLa_
anlhem, though the arranger w se ,
avoids putt ing a drum set behind'r
effeclive selting.

Kings afonent (David Ayma)Leve E -

2100. Here ls a cute Chris lmas i lem i ' , !
Ema : H Y P E R L I N K
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work rs recoded on lhe new Black Dyke continued on page i:
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Three Klrgstransformed into2/4 lime by
Ch ilean Saivationrst David Ayma. Th is is
a short  romp thatwi l lgo down wel lwth
band a nd audience. Ou r manuscript pa ris
were hard to read (toosmal )butthis was
not lhe finalformat for ihe piece.

The Salvat ion Army - At lanta, 1424
No(heast Expressway. At lanla, GA

Box 157. Gloucestershire. GL1 lLW
U K
I el :  01 1 -44- 1 452-524-438i Emai l :
HYPERLINK 'r ,ai l  Ia:  wrighl-and-
round@inleract ive-sciences co uk
w r i g h t - a n d  r o u  n d @ i n l e r a c t t v e  -

Paintings Canvasses from East Anglia
{Derek Eroadbent) Level l\r. T 9--10 00
approx. This is del ghlfully u ncomplicated
m!sic wilh a warm spirit and effective y
scored formidlevelbands. There are 3
movemenls, each referring to famous
painters and their landscapes or por-
trai ts deal ing with EastAng ia subjects.
Mvt 'l i A View Near the Coast/Thomas
Gainsboroug h; refere nce to lhe pa inting
scenes "Calm Seas Glstening, Peace-
ful  Folk Rest ing and Storm Clouds
Th reatening.' lvlvt 2: Travellers/S irAlfred
J. M!nningsi reference to lhe paintrng
scene "Romany horses, 'neath sunny
autumn skies i read gent ly through the
peaceiul  counlryside." I \ rvt  3:  Wliam
Wollaslon/Thomas Gainsboro!gh; A
po. irai i  o i  ih is MB, mi l i l ra member, and
player of the one-keyed f lute Each
movement could sland on i ls own, but I
think lhis pLece would be best heerd as
an eni i re sute The Reading Band
sounded greal on the final movement,
which captures very wel l lhe essence of
a d gnrf ied counlrygent eman whors pad
soldier,  country squire, and amateur
mus c an!

Dreams andAspiratbns(Tony Cl ff) Level
MD.T7:00approx. Tony Cl i f f  would nol
be well known in ihe L,S, but lhis score
would be a good way to gel to know lhis
rnleresting and talented muslcian. The
score has declded rock and pop music
inflections, in a f ne post-modern blend
The music wi l l  be chal lenging mosl ly
only the rhythmic level,  though I  would
think Youth bands for which the music
is part iculary wel l  suied, would fp
through this {un score.

Warner Brothers Publications/lnter-
nat ional Music Pub. 15800 NW 48th
Ave, Miami, FL 33014. Tel: a77-297-
7544, emai l :  HYPERLINK mai l  to:
m i ke_g re e n@ wa rn e rch a p p e I l. co n
mike-g reen@w amerch appell. com Hete
are two of a fine new series of pieces
released on the newWarner Bros brass
band series. Conlact Mike Green for a
complete is lrng.

N ulc rccke r " Sweel" (f chaikovsky/l\rark
Freeh) Level MD. T9:00 approx. Here s
something differentforChr slmasl l,'lark
Freeh has given us a transformed Nut-
crackeralongthelrnesof D!ke Ellington s
experimenls with famous classics
Openingwith a br ightswing sel i ing ofthe
opening l\,,liniatufe Overlure, Freeh then
inlercperses various dances, some more
slraighttorward lhan oihersl TheChildren's
I\,,larch, for instance, starts orJl straight,
andthen suddenlyshif ts intoswing. How
aboul Waltz ofthe Flowers changed inlo
a fast dr iv ing swing? Perhaps lhe mosl
intrgu ng is lhe Arabian Dance turned
into a Rumba Try it! | bet your audi-

Peanul vendot (Moises Simons/l\Ia*
Freeh) Level [ ,4 T4:00+ A realclassic
from the 1930s, this great Lal in hi t  gets
revived in fine style hefe in a selling that
should prove purc camp, and one thal
wi l  get lhe band and audience real ly
going. The piece is based on a two-bar
"[,,lontuna Feel" vamp. Various mem-
bers of the bend augme nt th e percussron
section by picking up various Latin in-
struments; a secure sel player is man-
datory, of course. The vamp is very
cleady notaled in the score and a hythm
sheei so that bands get justthe ight feel
thal esseniialio such a repetitive rhyth-
mic pattern There are some neal and
challeng ng riffs for lhe trombone and
cornet sections This piece can go as
long as you wanl,  and a ski l l fu l  band
cou d open i t  up for solos.

30329 ; 4A4-728-13a3
usasoulh@aol.com. These ilems are
from the American Instrumenlal  En-
semble Series (fo rme rly American I |ass
Ensernble Series) edited by James
Curnow. The arrangemenls may be
played by a group as small as a quartet
(with sth part oplional and two percus-
sion parts), or by a lull brass band,
concert band, or orchestra. Parts sup-
pi ied in al l  appropriale keys and clefs.
Providesfull scoreand piano parlreduc-
tion. To rcceive a Compact disc contain-
ing al l  16 arrangement avai lable contact
the IJSA Sorjth Music Department

What Child ls lhis (James Culnow)
Level E. T 2:40. An extremely effective
sett ing ofthe tune "Greensleeves" sui i -
ableforbrassquartel through large band.
Clrnow is a masler at lh s k nd of set-
l ing, pul l  ng off  a minimasierpiece ai ihe
grade2 level,  atrue gi f l  indeedl Etfect ve
percussion parls add measurably lo the
success of ihis l t t le gem. I  wou d havge
no hesitat ion using ths wi lh a arge-
scale brass band of the most advanced

PasslonChora/e(J.S Bach/NoelJones)
Level VE. T2:20. This Grade 1 sei t ing of
"O Sacred Head Now Wo!nded" would
be greal fora band warm-up, especially
new bands st i l l f i l l lng in the gaps oftheir
nstrumentat ion. l twi l  alsobeavaluabie
add t ionforbrassensembles and church
groups desperate for qualiiy music duc

Wnght&Round. The Cornel Office. PO
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BERNEL MUSIC LTD
Looking for the newest and the latest?

It is ALL here at BERNEL MUSIC

Music:

New Music by Phil Sparke, Goff Richards
and many others

GDs:
New recordings by Williams Fairey, Black Dyke,

Grimethorpe Colliery and many others

CD production
GREAT NEW prices andservrces for your next CD

INSTRUMENTS
Super prices on Willson and Besson!!!

New catalogs - music and recordings

BERNELMUSIC LTD
bernelw@te.net
bernelmusic.com

P.O.Box 2438, Cullowhee, NC 28723
(828) 293-7469 phone and fax
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Subnifted by Thonas A. MyeB
Past President and Past Editor

As lmanage the stage forthe Champion-
sh ips, keeping everyone on track and on
time, there are only a few moments lo
listen to the bands. Since this year's
Championship seclion test piece (Philip
sparke: Cambidge Yanallons) was a
tour de force for our percussionists, I
stepped asideforafew minutesto nolice
how well the percussion seclions were
doing and lo updale my previous com'
ments aboul snare drum selection for
blass band,

Wthoul question, Spa*e's tesl piece is
a dramaticchallenge, a challenge that in
most cases was met handsomely bY
each percussion seclion. I havewo*ed
many of our championships, and I be-
lieve the percussion sections this year
were the most focused, most accurate,
and clearly the mostmusical. Theyalso
exceeded the performanca slandaf dstor
prote66ional percussionists by a wide
margin ' that is, the percussion teams
would be just as welcome in a greal
orcheslra as in a gr6al brass band -
allhough th6 brass band offers morc
interesiing, more challenging, and more
rewarding opporlunilies to play. At the
debul concert of my Screamers & Lyric
Brass Band a few yeals ago, Scotl
Johnston, professor of trumpet at the
University ofAkron, joined our solo cor-
net bench for lhe conced. He was
familiarwith British brass bands buthad
never played in one. At the conclu sion of
the concert, he said with pieasure,
"Whew, I cedainly don't gel this kind of
a great and enjoyable workout when I
play an orcheslra perforrnance." lt isihe
same for our percussionists.

Congralulations toeach of ouf colleagues
In the percussion seclion - Exlremely

And nd on 10 snare drum sound, from a
dtbdols vEwpoint.

A brass band has a wonderful range of
sound, from the cornels and lrombones
on the brightside tothebell-up saxhorns
wilh theircomplexovertones. Sowhat is
the best snare drum sound to select?

For the rich and genefally mellow sound
ofthe brass band, we wanta snare drum
lhal complemenls and supports lhe
brass. Thatleadsusquicklytoadarkish
and warm sound with a nicely complex
color. The slighlly brighter snare drum
sound that needslo fightitsway through
ihe strings and upper woodwinds of an
orchestra lo be heard (orto complement
ihem)is simply too brighl for brass band
" it will slick oui way too much. Oitto for
jazz, rock, country, and moslothersnare
drum selups.

Unfortunately lho snare drums used by
a tew ot the day's bands in the Honors
and Championship sections werc drums
with thin melal shells and spiral wiro
snares. Regardless of the drum heads
used, ihese bright beasls cause the
band io sound like a tin drum solo with
brass band accompanimentand distract
from almost every perlormance inwhich
they are !sed. Give thos6 drums along
with earplugs (seriously, drummers
should play with musician's earplugs to
protectagainsihea ngdamage)loyoung
aspiring rock groups. Since it is not
likely that they will take the drum, the
leastyou can do istoss the spiralsnares
and install dry cable snares, discussed

A wood drum shell is a musl for ihe
sound weseek, along with cablesnares
and thin batter and sna.e heads, per-
fectly tuned a bii low- You will need to
change the thin heads more frequently
than lhick ones, but the reward will be
much better color.

I previously reported inthe Bridgeon how
to tune lhis combination. lf you would
like a copy of that adicle, as well as
Bridge adicles on cymbal selection and
bass drumluning, pleasesend a double-
stamped self-add ressed envelope, 9x 1 2
or larger, lo me at 4716 Warm Hearth
Circle, FaidaxVA22033-5075,and lwil l
be happy to help you.

The right dru msticks a lso will h elp darken
the sound. I\,4y preference continues to
be the Tom Gauger model TG17 (now
made by Vic Firlh). For lighter work, I
suggest his models TG16 and TG15.
Obviously, you should stay with your
curent sticks if you love them.

VVl1ich Championship seclion band best
achieved lhe desircd snare drum sound?
This year, it was lhe Brass Band of
Columbus. Gary Hodges does a beau-
titul job at tuning his Noble & Cooloy
Solid Shell [4aple Classic snare d ]m, 5
inchos deep by 14 inches in djameter.
He uses an Evans Genora Orchestral
Concert batler head and an Evans Gen-

conlnued on Pa96 38

Gary Hodges gracefully glides through
a lom-tom sequence while James
I\roore proves it is just as imporlant to
count the rests as PlaY.
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era Snare Side 200 head. He adds a
Noble & Cooley dampening ring, either
the smallest ring or lhe nedium, de-
pending on the situation, and has never
used morethan one ringata t ime -which
just proves thal he is a masl€r of drum
tuning. His difficult-to-duplicate secret
is his Hinger cable snarc, which has nol
been manufacturcd for a lew decades.
Gary's pedormances are simply glod-

Gary recently retired after serving 27
years as a music educator (including

band director) in the Dublin city public
schools. One of his early pedormance
experiences was in lhe armed services
as a percussionisi with the U.S. Air
Force Academy Drum & Bugle Corps.
Following ihe service, he en.olled as a
m!sic education mator at lhe Ohio State
Univercity, majoring in percussion, but
played lrumpet in lhe Ohio Stale March-
ing Band. The BBC has been forlunete
to have his m!sicaltalents in the percus-
sion secl ion foraboul 15 years- but lhe
solo cornet bench knows it has a ca-
pable backup just a drumstick away.

Coming in a closesecond in thrs informal
competition was Dr. Oon Parker's drum
wilh lhe Saint Louis Brass Band Don's
wood shel lwascustom-madelorhim so
lhat stays a secret (pppr Clarence Wl-
liams). lts size is 5.5 jnches deep by 14
inches across. His batter head is a
Remo coated Emperor and hls snare
head isa RemoAmbassador. Don isthe
Associate Professor of l\rusic and Direc-
tor of Percussion & Jazz Studies al the
Un iversity of M issou ri Saint Louis, so for
Ilexible sounds, his drum is configured
with a kiple and ttinable snare that pre-
viously was manufactured by Black
Swamp Percussion for Tom Freer, lhen
with Clevelander Drum. (Black Swamp
no longer makes lhal padicular sna€
setup, bul  you can get a bui l t - in simi lar
quad sysiem ifyou buy their l\rultisonica
drums. Clevelander Drum offers an ad-
justable tiple combination that will be
too bright for brass band.) For the
Championship section performance, Don
used two of his lhree available snares:
the gold coated cable (for a dry gul-like
sound) along with the spiral wire to
brighten the gold lt gave him an adicu-
lalesoundwith gooddepth. His uncoated
slainless steel cable remained otf. An-
other of oon's secrets is his laminated
business card (one side is the card, the
other side is felt) lied to a string lhat is
tied 10 his drum; il is used todampen the
batterhead when needed and also iden-
tities the drum's owner in case they ever

get separaled - pretty slick. l\roon€.
lhe primary dampener - remains on !
batter head al l th6 t ime Thetoneof: !
drum and Don's wondedul play.t
sounded great. VVhy Gary first and 0('
next? | thought Don's snare setup
jlst a touch too bright for the band

Vviat should you buy to replace lhal:r'
drum?

For wood shells, consider the Noble I
Cooley Soljd Shell Maple Classic |||.
particula y the 7-inch de€p by 141nt
diameter drum and Gary's choice, thet
inch deep by 14-inch diameter lot
lheir  7- inch and 3.875-1nch. [r ly 3 8;5
inch is currenllyon loan lothe Cuyah€,
Valley Erass 8and, since lhey need-
the drum, and l found i t tedious lo fnd 6
fLln darnental resonance and get the dnt?
settled inlo the prccolo sound I wantec
It handles the delicale and arlicula
piccolo drum tasks very well, br.il do.'
expecl a big rich sound from it TIE
also hav€ my Yamaha s.s-inch sn-1
drum, which soundsgoodforbrassbar<
aswell. AlsoconsiderClevelanderOru-
Elack Swamp, Grover, and other h19.
end wood shel ls.  Youwil lpayqui le at
for lhese, bul they can be tuned v.a
easo andwill sound exactly rightforyo.r
brassband. lfyou search forawhile a'\c
are iucky, you may find a used one r
good condition wilh undamaged snar
beds at aboul half the cost.

Fordrumheads, lhewinnerc in my prer '
ous articlewere a Remo Diplomat bent
head (pl!s Noble & Cooley dafipen|n:
r ings)and an Evans Genera 200 snaP
head. I have not updaled my fonne.
exhaustive tesl ofdrumhead models. s:
you are on your own with the newes
alternatives.

Gary's and Don's snares are no longE/
manufactured. The snare winner In -l

The Saint Louis Brass Band: Don
Patker spins exactly the right English
on his sticks as l\ratthew Hake siarts
a iasteful cymbal clash.
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previous article was lhe grea!sounding
Grover Ofcheslral Cable snare, which is
sl i l lagoodchoice. In addit ion tothe dark
side of Grover's cable snare line, you
should considerthe Black Swamp (blue)
coaled cable snarc, which wi l l  bTend

steelcable is too br ight for brass band.

During the Championships, I  wes fo-
cused on what I needed lo do nexl, when
I heard this gorgeous maracas sound
from comlng from lhe stage. I immedi
atelywenl lo see lhe source. since great
malacas and greal maracas perlormers
are infrequent.  So the CuyahogaVal ley
Brass Band w ns lhe award forthe besl
maracas sound and performance. Rique
Pizarro was lhe talenled percussionisl
perform ng her beeutful  instruments
(Lal in Percussion Fiber l \ laracas - steel
shot, black hard plastrc spheres, natural
wood handles). Herthr lling performance,
played so well, was quite a wonderful
surpr ise. When I  real ized whatbandwas
playing I guessed cofiectly that Rique
had been a student of Dr Larry Snider
(percussion professor at the University
oi Akron who was interviewed for the
previous adice on bass drum t!ning),
since Larry is so greai al musicai preci"
sion wi lh maracas, tambourines, and
s l e g h  b e l l s ,  a s w e l l a s w t h  a l l t h e  o l h e r
percuss on instrufnents lt used to be
lhat lhebestmaracassound, oudenough
lo be heafd in a band ororchestra, came
from copper toilet floals converted into
maracas. Rlque's inslruments had an
equal lyaudibleand much nicersound. I
greauy enjoyed her all-too-bief pedor-
mance on maracas.

Gary, Don and Rique will receive a pair
of my custom-made fff Brass Bandcym-
ba brushes ioihankthemforthe percus-
sive pleasure they provided to us on
Saturday.

One oiher observaiion: The mosi ad-
vanced bands used a team offolks, not
jusi  the percussionisis,  to move lhe
percussion instruments on the slage
and off. For lhose bands, l believe those
other playerc share the percusslonists'
disproportionately large ogistical tasks
al l  the l ime. That has always made

So, forlhis loverof percussionandbrass,
itwas a most wonderfu I Champions h ips I
I look forl^/ad io being with you next rn
Little Rock.

Lrnks:

clevelandenlrum.com
evansdrunheacls.com

iom cam (for Moongel)

Alsa see vicfitthgaurme!.com to pepper
and smooth your playingl

Rique Plzarro begins decaying a bass

ncely with mosi brass band music.  Se-
lect the Black Swamp gold-coated cable
snare for a darker dry, and gulty sound
that is especlal ly good for i radi iona
rnarches 3nd lield dr!ms. Follow Black
Swamp's websi ie instrucl ions on tuning
the gold snare uneven y to gel the besi
a.ticulalion and voice across the drum s
:. .amic range; i t  works. The blue is a
: e br ghter ihan ihe gold and is more

a1:,ale In sof l  passages. I  bel ieve
33-_. sH ngersnare sound is between the
: - , :  a-:  i re 9o d The Black Swamp
:r-a --a:.r b !e and uncoated staiilless

The grip for Rique Pizarro's ma€cas
solo was most effeclive.
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Lisled in Alphabetical Order by Title;
Reviews by Ronald W Holz unless oth-

but lvloor has been able to capture the
sound ofthis rather br i l l iant band without
distortion. The other excellenl band,
Fodens, providessomeflne playingfrom
the Gala Conce.t, including a comp ete
reading wilh profess iona I trum peter Rod
Franks (a real polished player), of the
Arutunian Corcedo. Franks also plays
wi lh an al l  star group cal led Youth Brass
2000 who also play very wel indeed.
There are many attracUve tracks on this
f ineCD. l love l ive recordings, andlhis is
indeed a good onel

NABBA Member Band Recordings

Pressing Onward Cincinnati Bress
Band (Anlta Hunt).  Cincinnat i  Brass
Band CD 001 TT Program: Pr.essirg
Onward (Leidzen)t  The Shipbui lderc
(Yorke)i  Horn fr ia:  Tr io Con Bio
(Langlod)i Soprano Sola: Bring Him
Home(SchonbergA / krnson),soloistPat
Counts A Disney Spectacular
(Richards)i A London Ove,,lul€ (Spark€);
Hynn For Diana lftrtin): Land of Frce-
dom (Bdla) Anencan Civil Wal Fan-
lasy (Bilik/Himes); Ihe Honlrcss (King/
Ga lehue).

Our eff ic ient and gracious hosts al
NABBA 2002 released theif first com-
pact d sc in t me for our confe rence and
i l  is a disc ihai  proveswhy they afe held
in high regard as an effective, award-
winning band marked by mult iple vcto-
fes in our Honors Level compei i i ion.
Right fronr ihe opening tiile march by
Leidzen you are met by a clean, tuneful ,
controlled band whose cond!clor pays
cose at lenlron to al l  rnusical  param-
eters. Two ofthe majorworks Included
The Sh ipbuilders and London Ovefture
are heard inlhe band's liveperformances
ai NABBA 2001 in Washington This is
always isky, butthebandcan hold iheir
heads high. There is f ine ive playing
here, and in good. aggressive siyle.
Stylistic versalility is also a hallmark of
lhe band and lhls program, from the
longue'in-cheek ilalian-classics postcard

Trio Con Brio lot lhtee horns to wha:
considel the centerpiece ( l i teral ly and.
terms of playing) ofthe d sc, Richards I
Disney Speclacular The band rea ,
sparkles here on a rather challeng n!
1 1 -minute sui te (good sol i  playing by t | {
band's anchorplayers) Cincinnat i  Brass
are equalto the task There is a c ass,
balance lo lhe overa ll program that, wh:{
having lots of var ety, never embrace:
ki lsch alwayssomething l loath in brass
band record ings. One perso na I hig h hg-
forme istheSopranosoloby PatCoLrnts
who offers up a lovely sound and flc.
melodic line on lhe Schonberg Eroar
way song BringHimHame. The recor'
ing is clear. both the lve excerpts frc-
NABBA and the majority recoded ar
home n Cincinnal i .  David Hendersc_
served asthe engineerin bolh inslancea
so a good malch has been made Cc'
gratulat ions lo anotherdebut album bt a
f ine NABaA bandl i

Stike Up the Band. Saint Louis Bras
Band (Keith Wilk inson and Shane ! \  -
l iams) STLBB. TT 62:03. Progra-
Slike Up lhe Band lGershwin/Richards
A Landa n Ove du re (Spatke); Cornel Sc,:
One Fine Day (Puccrliryilkinson). S.-
lolsf lrary Weber lnpehal Edwa..
(SousaMeatherail); Flugel Solo Mrs:.
(Burke/Barry) Soloist  Jason Har s
Euphon um Solo Camival of  Ventc.
(Arban^/Vilkinson) Soloist Jeff B n.s
Lon do nde rry Ai r (Wealhetal): Si ma ra r.
(Barraclough); Baritone Solo Sorgs //.
f/lothet Taught Me (Dvorak/Langford
Sooisl  Edward Jacobs A Psa/m c'
Pratse (C!rnow); Soprano Solo Brf:
Hrar Home (Schonberg^\/ilkinson) Sc-
lo st Edca Sparks; StLouisB/ues(Hand,
Geldard).

In 19gg St Lours Brass Band rnade :s
NABBA debul by taking First Place -

the Chalenge Sect ion. Two years a:e
they iook First Place, again, lhis t me _

I am grateful to Paul Droste and Robin
Weatherallfor providing reviews on re-
cordings forwhich I provided linernotes.
Robin has agreed, by the way, to take
overthe compacl disc review sectiof of
lhe Bridge starting wth lhe December
2002 issue. lwi l  be on sabbat ical leave
and this wi l l  be the ideal t ime for a new
vorce lo be heard in our publ icat ion. I
express specral lhanks to those of you
who have laken the t ime to give Col ln
Holman and me some feedback on the
Brdge. lt is nice to know thal sorne of
you actually read and appreciate our
stuf{, even ifyou don't a ways agree with
usl

Live Brass Band Concert Recordinos

MaslerBrass Valune Xll (2001 AI En-
gland Masters). 'Br ighouse&Rastr ick
Band (Wthington),  +Fodens Coudois
Band (Hurdley),  Trumpet Soloist  Rod
Franks, and#Youth Brass 2000 (Jeans).
Polyphonic OPRL 212D. TT 70r30. Pro-
gtam. + Ruslan &Ludmll /a (Gl inka/
Hargreaves)t + Gaelfa rce (Gfthem);
#Trumpet Solo Sunsh/re of Your Smile
(Arr Hume); #ScarbororghFalr(Smith/
Ctees): #Excetpt from Four French Re-
naissance Dances (Praetoriu s/Anth u n );
+Sh/l?e As lre Llghf (Gfaham)i *Pag-

e antry lqowells)t + Pink Panther Theme
(t4ancini/Barry); + Tru mpet Ca nce ft o
(Arutunian/Antrobus); +The Day Thau
Gavesl(ar. Wlby); +E lry of lhe Gladi-
ators (Fucik)

Polyphonic's recording wizard, lvlichael
i\,4oor, has pulled off another miracle in
ihis excellent live recording ofone ofthe
bestfestivals in the brassband calendar.
The centepiece is a f ine, aggressrve
winning performance of Pageanlry
(Howells) by Brighouse&Rastrick. The
hal l ,  the Cambridge Corn Exchange, can
be easi y overblown by these greai bands,
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the Hono6 Section. This recording,
madejust a few weeks afterthat second
victory, demonstrates theia commitmenl
to constantly improving, always pursu-
ing musical excellence. Theirdynamic,
aggressive performance here of the 2001
Honors test, Lonclon Ovenure, slands
as a iestament to lhat approach to
banding. Wlkinson is a stickler for de-
tail, and STLBB places it all together
quite nicelyforhim. Thatsameapproach
is evidenl in their tackling ol Curnow's
demanding A Psaln of Pralse, an ideal
choice, by the way, for this particular
band, Five secure soloisls are show-
cased, and on all the lraditional brass
band inslruments: soprano/cornevf lugel/
bar i tone/euphonium. This is not oniy
smart programming, but it deve ops key
players for the kind of solo playing a
championship band musl have. Robin
Wealheral l jo ns Keith Wlkinson as an
arranger of several effeclive program
items, each fepresenled by two. I hope
Robin's good afangement of So!sa's
less-often-hea rd march / npeial Edward
gets wide play. Sousa's augmenled
sounding of God Save the King in the
middle of lhings is a real lreatl The
recording has a spacious sound which I
found enhanced by cranking the volume
lusta bi l  morethan on some brass band
recordings l l  is a del ight to see ihe
exce llent success of ou r NAB BA ban ds.
STLBB can be counied among ouf most
successful in so rnany areas: conlest
viclones corporate support, oaganiza-
uonalstructure leadership pattern. l i  is
a joy to have this fine samp e of their
var ied musicaloffer ings. Aga n, kudos
loWlkinson and St Louis foranotherf  ne
NABBA band debut CDI

Brass Band Recordinos lNon-Sa val on
&my)

Declaralion OvertLlre (Smilh/Golt);
Mumbo Jumbo: Godspe// (SchwerE/
Gott)i Horn Solo Adagto (Corelli/Gott),
Solorst George Thackrayt Let There Be
Pra,se (Tunney/Gotl); Jazz Suie; Alto
Trombone Solo Adaglo iTarlini/Gott),
soloist Chris Jeans; L,;ghtwal& G/ass-
house Sketches; Daniel, Danny Boy
(Baker/Gott)i Gospe/ Lai n ; Ap p alachi a n
Ovedure (Barnes/Gott).

Barrie Gotl has been in the forefront of
"contempo€ry" brass band wriling and
arranging forboth SAand non-SAbands
since the lale 1960s. ln this cross-
sect ion of his or iginal  music and ar-
r a n g e m e n t s / t r a n s c r i p t i o n s ,  T h e
Ransome Band and Russel lGray al low
us a chance lo reviow some of lhal
contribltion of over lhirly years and to
also hear rccenl works that we may not
be familiar with. For Baftie Gotl has
w tten much more than the ubiquitous
Lighl Walkat his eatly jazz-rock version
ol Dare to be a Daniel Gotl now resides
in Brisbane Auslrala having sel t led
back in his homelandafteralengthyslay
in the USA He currenl ly direcls the
Brisbane Temple SA Band and wo*s as
a professional music educalor lhrough-
oul Queensland. His G/asshouse
Skelches is an examp e of his recenl
or iginal  wri l ing, a 10-minute work com-
missioned for the 1999 Grade C Austra-
l ian Brass Band Championships (Chal-
lenge Level might be comparable).  The
m ddle lune in this pop-style work is a
flne examp e of Gott's song-writing ca-
pacity. The 3-movemenl Jazz Suile was
also a commiss oned wo*, this t  mefor
lhe Nat ionalYouth Brass Band of Swit-
zerland. Golt asks youthful fiusicians
lo tackle rock. cool-jazz and then latin
orsalsa siy les. In ihis his good d scern
menl as a music educaiorcomes to the
fore Thisisalsotrueof hisadaptai ionof
Barnes' po pu la r wind-ba n d Appalachian
Overture. Two surprises were the Corelli
Adaglos, very effective solo works, ihough
fewbandswou d havesoloaltotrombon-
rsts, no doubl setting ior a less-rare

rnstrlmenl. Gotl would be lhe first to
admil thet he does not write "profound"
music;  hewould counler,  rather,  that he
writeswhathefeels can be useful, enjoy-
able, effective in leaching musicalcon-
cepts, and also music liable to bring a
smile to the face oflhe average lislener.
This is a valuable rejoiceforbands seek-
ing to expand theif "pop" nusic reper-
toire.

Wi ndows of ! he Wo dd. Y orkshire Build-
ing Sociev (David King) Forlhe Love
ofa Prrcess (Horner/Duncan); Molly on
the Shore (Grainger/S nell); Soprano Solo
Casta Dlva (Bel l in i /Roberls),  Soloist
Peier Robertsi Slaughler on 10th Av-
enue(Rodgers/Smilh);  Euphonium Solo
Shepte/d Song (David), Soloist llrorgan
Griffiths; Sl/verMourtal, (Richards); Horn
Solo Pipat A' Dundee lDownie), Soloist
Sheona White; Hym, forDlana (Turrin)i
Beautiful Wold lDawnie): Wndaws of
the Wortd lctaha'r.).

The combination of YBS and David King
in contesthas been unmatched in recent
years as they won the Erltish Open in
1997,1999 & 2001, The Al l  England
lrasters in 1999 & 2000 andTheEuro-
peanChampionsh pin 1996,1S97,1999,
2000 & 2001. This latest CD from Poly-
phon c showcases notonly theband bul
several of ihe fine soloists that are ihe
foundat ion of this sp endid group and as
I expected the title refers lo a musical
journey aroundthe world culminat ing Ln
Peter Graham's suite, Windows of lhe
L,Yord Only h^/o of the len pieces are
new to CD; "Cavat na" ftom Noma by
Bellini a d Beautiful Wold by Kennelh
Downie. Cavatina ("Casta Diva") ls an
excellent veh cle for soloist Peler Rob-
edswho proves, yetagain, lhal  he is one
ofihe world's very finest soprano cornei
playerc. The smooth technique and fluid
sound are perfeciion he makes whal is
obviously a difficult solo sound easy.

Munbo Jumbo: The Music of Barrie
Gol l  The Ransome Band (Russel l
Gray).  EgoSFZ 108. TT62 40. Program: continued an page 42
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Beautiful Wold is lypical Ken Downie at
his lyrical best, a six-minute piclure of
the British counlryside based on the
chi ldren's hymn'Al l  Things Bright and
Seauti tul ' .  l t  is lovingly played by YBS
wrth style ideal ly sui ted to this chatming
work, SheonaWhite is featured in awork
she has recorded before with YBS;per-
hapslhrs isthesemerecording? Sheona
is respected as one of the finesl of the
young€r generation ofTenor Horn p ay-
ers and s he demonskates here bi9 sound
and admirabletechnique to perfection on
Downie s P ipe r O' Du nd ee. YBS show ofl
their techn cal prowess with a spirited
pedotmance ol Molly on l,le Sho/€ and
offer a particrilarly moving performance
of Hymn fot Diana, a work which has
tound a worthy place in lhe repertoire of
many bands over lhe past couple of
yearc. Addtothat a newarangemenl of
Slaughler on 10th Avenue by Sandy
Smith, a silky rendering ol Silver Moun-
lalr, lhe smooth Euphonium playing of
Morgan Grifllths in a charming new ar-
rangeme nt of Sh9pherd Song by Trevor
Davis. And you come lo lhe litle kack,
Windows of thg Wodd by PeterGraham.
YBSand David King premieredthismajor
work al  the 2000 E!ropean Champion-
ships in Birmingham. craham lakes us
on a m u lticu ltural journey using soloists
and percussion lo greateffect. The driv
ing Lal in beat ofAmazonia, the luscious
sounds of Sheona White s Tenor Horn
and l\rargaret Antrobus Baritone ac-
companied by only the lower band in
Rain Forest, throlgh The Rising Sun,
Drums ofThunder,  and Celt ic Dream to
Tru mpel soloist Ben Godfey and d rum set
soloist  St ian Vi l langer in thejazz based
Earth Walk. Altogether an interesting
and varied CD wilh the llrstclass playing
one expecls of thrs splendid band
Revlewed by Robin Weatherall.

Salvation Armv Brass Bands

The Saund of Edlalr'. Household

Troops Band (John l\rott). SP&S. SPS
CO 156. TT72:18. Prcgtam: Manhaltan
(Leidzen);  fhe Sound al  Br i tain
(Bearcroft)i For Our Trcnsg.essions
(Calvert)i Cornel Solo C/earSkles (Ba ),
Soloisl Carl Saunderc; Cornel Duet De-
/ ive.arce (Calel inel)  Soloisis Carl
Saunders, Craig SnelLi  lhe Spir / t
(Steadman'Allen)i Fanfare of Prctse
(Redhead); B/,lan'a (Smith); Spilfrle
Prclude and Fugue lwalton); Askl (Gl.a-
ham) Euphonium Solo Holy Welllcra-
ham), Soloist Keith Loxleyt Greal Day
(Bearcroft)i llme lo Shne (lvlackereth).
Jubilee lDtury).

The firsl great SA brass band was the
Household Troops Band, the forerunner
of lhe lSB. Foundedin June 1887 (same
month as the NYSB), it soon toured all
over the IJK and in 1888, Canada and
lhe US. Thai tour translormed the f  edg-
ing SA brass band scene rn both of
those cou ntnes; they were thefirsl greal
model band in the SA. Since 1985 {a
hundred years afterthefirst Lile cuards
Band campaign thal set the pattern for
lhe HTB), when conductor John lvlotl
fevrsed the concept of a spectal cam-
paig n band called the Household Troops,
this band has made quite a name for
themselvesduaing lheirshorl  lours This
Springlheband returnsto NorlhAmenca,
and lhis disc is lheir  lour alburn. l t  is a
splendid example of the musical and
spir i lua zealot this f ine group ofyoung
bul accompl shedpLayerswho aredrawn
irom some ofthe iinest SA corps bands
throughout the UK (Engtand, Scottand,
Wales, lreland) Despite only getting
logetheron occasion they p ay al  a very
high standard They havea f ine array of
good sooists and good, enledainrng
musrc repfesenting a wide range of sA
music. Vvlile all their musrc rs pre
sented with great ' l lare and care' ,  their
march playing isvery captivating, and on
a wide variety of march styles: Manhal-
I a n, B itann ia, G real Day, and J u bi lee. I n
ierms of longer works, Bearcroft's 4-
movemenl suile lhe Sound of Btitain a

standby ot lhe Canadian Statf Ban:
under him years ago, gets a refreshrn:
revival. Bearcrofl is also the wriler of the
shorlbul informalive ljnernotes given lc.
each i tem One niceaddi l ion unusual: '
an SA recording is a kibute io the \^I-
liam Walton centenary (1902-2A02) r
the form of Wallon's ftajestic and excr-
ing Spilfire Prelude and Fugoe (lhoug'
lhe arranger is nol identified). By the
lime mosl of our readers get this issu€
Household Troops will have already fir-
ished their tour Here's a greal way 1:
calch a very inleresting, solid band w|F
a greal history on a fine, enlerlainrn3
disc

Solo Albums

Two ol a Mind 'Doug Yeo, Eass
Trombone; +Nick Hudson, TenorTrom-
bone, wilh William6 Falrey Band (Tho.
mas Wyss) and #David Chapman, P"
ano. Egon SFZ 107 TT72:16. Progran
Ouel Trombone lnstilule of Technolog'!
(Davis);'v,illtant (Walson): 4 Duel fror.
Canlala 78 lBachlYeoJ: +Concentn.
(Leidzen)i  'Mr Nlce 6uy (Droverl
+#Q./esllo/,s (Camsey); '#fhe Ca
(Vaughan Wil l iams); +tsi lenl  Noor
(Vaughan Vvilliams) Duel Fire Divine
(Watson);'#Conce/.to (Lebedev); #Due:
Paslorcle (Ewazen): +My Funny Valen.
fire (Rodgers/Drover); DueI Cunenls
(Wolfe).

Two terrific kombonists team up in I$r:
of a Mindfar awondertJlprog ram of solos
and duets marked by greatvariety. tech-
nicalassurance, and above al l ,  matur€
musical lyricism. This latter character
islic dominates. The two Vaughan Wr
liams lranscriplions are a case in pornt
each ofthe team delivering lovely inte:'
pretatrons, Hudson on shorl lyric soia
song S/erfNoon and Yeo on "The Ca l'
ftom Five Mystical Sorgs. There erE
ihree rmportant (large-scale) works the:
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receiving readings that can be placed
among lhose considered "definilive':
Hudson's majest ic approach to the
Leidzen Concenino, lhe Yeo's splendid
resurrecton ofthe Tuba and Piano ver-
sion of the Lebedev Concerto lor Bass
Ttumbone, and Ewazen s Paslorale.
This lalter work dal€s from 1993 in the
Ini t ia l  version for Flule, Horn, and Piano,
bui here reworked for tenor and bass
trombonewith piano. This istruly beau-
liful music. Vvlat I also found attraclive
was the alternalion between band ac-
companiment,  piano accompaniment,
s o l o i s t s ,  a n d  d u e t s  -  e v e n  l h e
unaccompanied opening short duet by
Davis really draws you in ! Doug Yeo has
been known forhis high-quality, innova-
trve recordings. This is no exception in

lerms of literalure lnteFretation, qlality
of accompanimenls (band and piano),
and in lhe choice of a slellar partner. I
highly recommend lhis disc to al l  sei-
ous brass studenls not jusl  t rorrbon-
ists.  In addit ion lo your localdealer th s
disc is available thrcugh bolh artists
website \Men you get Into that website
you will see that Doug Yeo has compiled
comprehensive prog€m noles for the
entife disc: w!,r/wyeodoug.cam ard
www h udson 66.frease Ne. co. u k

Solo Albtirhs Wth Music and/or CD/
Kevboard Accomoaniment

Christmas Joy: lnslrumental Solos for
lhe Holiday Season (All A.ranged by
Stephen Bulla). Curnow llrusic, 2001
Available for various solo inslruments
(See Greal Hymns review belowforde-

tails) wilh keyboard accompaniment, or
with CD Demoperformance and accom-
panimenl (midi/electronic version). Pro-
gtam: Tuning Noles; We Wsh You;
Angels From the Realns; In the Bleak
Midwinlef Good King WenceslaslJolly
AH Sl Nick; Away in a Mangec Wassail
Song: WeslminslerCarot O Holy Night
I t C ame U po n a M id n ig hl Cl eac Cove nlry
Caral;  Greensleeves: O Come

Gloia!: lnslrumenlal Solos for Easlel
(Stephen Bul la).  Curnow lrusic,  2001.
Same as tor Ch slmas Joy except ac-
companiment CD only no midi  demo
performance. Program: IarmgNoles;
Christ the Lorcl Is Risen Today: Chnsl

conlinued on page 44

MIDLAND CD CLUB

Midland CD ClLtb is a mail ordercompany specialising in Brass & Military Band CDs.
We are based in the UK and have hundreds ofcustomers all over the world,

and have an especially loyal customer base in America and Canada.

Please visit our website, and we hope to be able to add you to our customer list.

www. mi dland-c d- c I ub. co. u k
e-mail sales(Dmidland-cd-club.co. ak

201 Callowbrook Lane, Rubery. Birminghan 845 gTG. UK
Telephone 0121-244-4605/4606 Fax 0l2l-680-9018
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Nose; Come Thou AlmighIy Kng; Crown
HimW h ManyCrcwns;Cone, Ye Faith-
tul: Golden Harys Are Souncling; Thine
ls lhe Glory; Passion Chorale; At the
Cross; Were You Therc?

Every year I receive phone calls from
area organisls and church musicians
askjng if there are a ny q ualily collections
of hymn arrangements tor solo instru-
mentalist and keyboard, especially for
Christmas and Easter. This Eastertide
alone I received tour such calls. ln all
honesty, the€were very fewthat lcould
recommend, until lhese two sets ar-
ranged by Stephen Bulla and handsomely
p.odirced by Curnow l\Iusic. Each set
contains twelve solos ideal for use in a
sacred service or concert setting. A
demo CD comes wi lh the solo book, lhe
Chrislmas CD conlaining boih a midl-
versrOn performance and ju sl the accom,
panament track, while th€ EasterCDjust
has the accompanimenl t6cks, Tuning
notesappearonlyatthe beginning of lhe
CD, br.itlhis is no real disadvanlage. The
mid,sounds chosen for lhe accompani-
ment arc certainly adequate, though I
w o u l d  a l w a y s  r e c o m m e n d  l i v e
keyboardist when availablel However,
Bu lla does not a lwaysjust use a sampled
keyboard, so lhis makes lor some tun
and interestwhen playing alongwith the
track. Bulla chooses to vary the solo
Instrumenl on lhedemo CD becausethe
book isdesrgned to be played by awide
range ot anstruments. I have copies of
the B Flat keble clef book (trumpet
clarinel, etc). The notation and layout
are just righl, easy to read, and well
rnarked with jusl the flght expressive
suggestions, Technical demands are
moderate lor the soloist and only rarely
more so for the keyboardist. Alternate
nolesare always provided ilthe aff an9e-
ment goes abovelhe statf for inslance.
Bolh collections range widely in style,
tempo, with a good cross-section of
maleria I su itable for these tlvo seasons.
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\ryhal really pleases me is lhe classic
restrajntand solid crafi smanship of these
arangements. Sooften the"stuf in this
markel is jusl unusable, in bad laste.
That is not lhe case with Stephen Bulla.
Highly recommend for all instrumenlat-
jsls lhatmustplay solos at the holidays.
Excellentforieaching situations as well
Word ot caution wilh any of these CDs
that come with solo books. cet a hard
case forthe CD ralherthan keep moving
lhe CD In and out of lhe plaslic sleeve
thal is glued in lhe book. One can
inadvertent ly damage orsoi l the CD and
thus render it inoperable Proper care
will insure long use.

Conceft Studies: 16 New Sludies fron
Grade 3 Through 6. Phillp Smith,
Trumpet. Curnow l\,4usic. 2001 Com-
pact disc of performance a nd sh eet m usic
booklel TT48:54. Program: Coronalion
(Joh n son ); Carierbury (H osay) Olympus
(Courl); Requiem (Bulla); Arabesque
(8ulla); Arlares (fwtin): Fanlale, Ca-
denza, and Schezo (Curnow); Poem
lgetnes); Prelude and Pantomime
lvtzzuli)t Prcnenade (Johnson)i Ro-
mance (Notbury) , Quadrille (Turrin); 8o-
lerc \Cwno\,!): Saltarello (Turin); Sprra/
Darc6 (Vizzuti); Street Scone (Sparke)

This excellent collection of shorl concert
sludies for solo lrumpet comes wilh a
superb CD pertormance by the adist for
whom they were written, Philip Srnith. A
impressive group of wnters were com-
missioned this grade series that ranges
from moderate lo difficult evel (grades
3--€)i Tim Johnson. James Hosay Doug
Court Stephen Bul la.  Joseph Turr in,
James Curnow James Barnes, Allen
V'zzut l i ,  Kevin Norbury and Phi l ip
Sparke i,4osl etude collections gei
boring very quickly either because the
wriling is poor despite lhe technical
hurdles addressed, orthey are al l in the
same style Th6 declsion to have ihis
wonderful range of composers makes
this colleclion all the more atlraclive.
The enl i re normalcompass ofthe l rum-

pet as gradually explored, from low wnf
ten F sharp to D above the staf{. Alt
lnannerof lechnicaland lyrical playing 6
Incorporated through lhe progressively
more difficultset. Th e dev€loping player
hes nol only up'to-dale etude malerial
lhey also have lhe model performance
theycanref€rto, oreven play along with
should they so choose. Whi le mosl
these pieces fil wellinto a study scheme
some might be seen to lranscend lhe
sludy piece and actually teature in a
trumpet recitalt th is would be particulady
true of the more advanced iterns, lik€
Turin's Sa/lanl/o, Sparke's Steet Scene
ot ll'zzuti's Spial Dancs. Indeed, the
lattetstarts out in a manner eminiscenl
of Vizzuti's very difficult solo pieces
Cascades. Yet even a few of the early
dems have lhat quality too, like Eulla's
eleganl Requiem, a lyric study lhal

continued on page 45
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Through an arangement with
Bern6lMusic, advertisers can now
pay with credit cards. We prefer
L,.S. adverlisers lo conttnue lo pay
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sounds like homage to Gabriel Faure. I
have lhoroughly enjoyed every one of
these sixteen etudes. They make musi-
cal sense, they challenge a player in a
wide range of technical problems, and
lhey demand attention beyond the rnere
prod uction of noles. And lh en lhe pedoF
mance of the CDI What can I say. but
here as anotherdemonslralion of Smith's
greal gills as one ofthe finest musicians
of ourday. All developlng comelists and
trumpeters should definilely have these
Concert  Sludies with demo C0. Final ly,
whrle the lhe targel eudience may be
trumpeters, alllreble-clef reading brass
musicians should also use this collec-
tion to improve their musical skill and
musicianship.

Grgal Hymns: lnstrumenlal Solos for
Worship. A'ranged by James Curnow
fo. solo inslrumenlalist wth keyboard
(piano and organ accompaniment) or CO
accompaniment.  Curnow Music,  2001
Solo part books available for 1) Flute/
Oboe^/iolini 2) B Flal ClarineUTenor
Saxophonei 3) E Flat Al to Saxophone;
4)B Flat Trumpei; 5) Troftbone/Eupho-
nium Bess Clef; 6) F or E Flat Horn.
Compacl Disc perfomances by Philip
Smlth, Trumpet,  with Becky Shaw,
piano, and I\richaei Rintamaa, organ
Oemo and Play-along CO. TT 51:51
Prcgtam. Tuning Note; All Creaturcs of
OutGod and Ring; Praiae to the Lord the
Almighty; Be Thou My Vis@n; O Wor-
ship the King; Joyful, Joyful, We Adore
Thea: Brelhren We Have Met Io Wor-
ship: We Gather Toqelhec I Sing the
Wondrous Power of God: A Mighty For-
tress; All Hail the Power

Vvlal I said about the Bulla sacred solo
collections above gels amplified and
accentuated in this excellent collection
of hymn atrangements by James Curnow,
superbly played by Philip Snrith and tlvo
excellent accompanists The iechnical
level is a bil more advanced on some of

the items, though again lhe editor al-
ways provides ossia, altemativeschoices.
Nolicethe multiple-use nalure of lhes€t;
it is not just for trumpet or cornet. Be
Thoo My Vision is now also available wilh
brass band accompanimeni and Brelh-
rcn, We Have Met Io Worship is a skillful
reworking of malerial from Jim's brass
band classic, Knoxville 1800. All lhe
olher items will be new lo most of us.
This is a lerriflc collection that makes a
major contdbution to a sadly neglect€d
orabused area ol  solo playing. Thisisa
must for solo pedormers and for stu-
denls of excellent brass performance.

Wind Band and Brass Ensemble Re-
cordrn9s

Ercaking the Cenlury:Grcat Bitish Mu-
sb lor Wind Band, Voluno 7. Centlal
Band ol  the Royal Alr  Force (Rob
Wifin)with Tuba Soloist'JamesGourlay.
PolyphonicQPRL 138D. TT67139 Pro-
gtam Breaking lhe Cenlury lclatke);
Hemming Way (Dankwonh):'Tuba Con-
cerlo (Horovi lz):  l / lustc lor Arosa
(Sparke); Evocalions (Ellerby).

ln lhis seveolh volume of British wind
band musicseveral of the recorded works
were first scored for brassband: grcak-
ing lhe Century and lhe Horovilz Tuba
Corcerlo. Breaking the Century was
commissioned for the Oxled Brass
Band's centenary, and then rewo*ed
into lhe current "dance overtu re" format,
a livelyworklasling jusl underT min!tes
Eesses O'the Barn Eand commissioned
the Tuba Concoio fot James Gourlay,
who lhen rescorad the work for wind
band, Gourlay providesan excellenl per-
formance of lhe three-movement, 20-
minule work here. The Sparke piece js

anolher excellenl example of Philip's
flne wriling, lhe title merely referring to
the fest ival forwhom work was commis-
sioned This is quintessenlial Sparke
and I would noi be surpised to see a
brass band version, as wel l ,  due to the
careful brass scoring. Ellelby s Eyoca-

tio,s is aimed ai Spanish and Latin
American subjecls, and unfolds as a
fou Fmovement suite: 1 ) Harlequin's Car-
nival;2) Death ofDon Quixote; 3) Sueno
(Dream); and 4) The Royal Hunt of ihe
Sun. The third movement, aftera poem
by Lorca, is parlicularly enchanting.
Dankworth's music was new lo me, btit
his lighthearted, almostlhird-stream style
(a blending of iazz elements and sym-
phonic skuclure) kept my interest. All
these pieces are played well by one of
Britain's finest military bands. The liner
notes includecommenlary byeach com-
poser of his music. The sound is clear,
full, even lush. This is an atlraciive
package of n6w music, much of it with
brass band roots, origin, or conneclion

Gaelforce: Musb for Wind Band by
PelerGrchen Royal Norwegian Navy
Band (Nige Boddice). Doyen DOYCO
083. TT 70:02. Ptogtam: Pentium;
Gaelforce; Summon lhe DQgon; Car-
lcnn Music: Windowsof the Wodd; North-
em Landscapes; Swedlsh Folk Song;
Montage: Symphony far Winds.

Can we admit that it is good lo have the
eats ol b€ss banders flushed, at leasl
occasionally, wilh the sounds ofa good
wind band? This disc by lhe Royal
Norwegian Navy Band is an oulslanding
exampl€ of an absolulely supeb wind
band playing music by Peter Grahem,
whom lhe brass band wodd claims as
oneof i tsown. Wth only one except ion,
al lof  th€se pieces are also avai lable in
the brass band format.  Thisisoneof lhe
finest recordings that I have heard - 70
minutes of pure enl ightenmenl and en-
joyment All titles are published by
Gramercy Music (UK). The opening
piece is called Pertx./m, but il is really an
elongated version of P,€eludium which
was publ ished for brass band in 1996.
This is an energetic piece thal will be
worth the iime end effort to learn it. ll

continued on page 46
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sparkles for almost 4 minuies and th€
brass bandversion has ashortalealo c
section el lhe end. The title piec€,
Gae/force, is a seiting of three Cellic
tunes. lf you lik€ the music of Percy
Grainger, you will really like Gaellorce.
Summon the Drcgon is a lanfare and
prelude jn the style ofJohn Vvilliams and
features lhe kumpels and lrombones.
Cadoor Music lives up to its title. Nalu-
rally, it is full of vaudeville slapstick and
other fiusical cliches (chase music
eic.) wilh lots of percussion. This is an
engaging and genuinely funny pjece.
Wndows of lhe Wolrd is a five-move-
ment journey in multiculturalism. The

musical versatility of both the composer
and the band is evident hete. Noihen
Lardscapes features brass quintet and
band and is a very usable piece for lhis
combinat ion. Graham has given us a
short, imaginalive arrangemenl of Swed-
ish Folk Song, belter known as How
GreatThou At1. Th€ CO concludeswith
Montage - Symphony for Winds which
was a brass band test piece in the 1994
All-England l\,4aslers. This audience-
fr iendly piece is a 15-m nute work in 3
movemenls l\lany will remember the
challenge of playing Graham s fhe Es-
sence of llme, the NABBATeSt Piece in
1995 (Toronto). There are many other
Graham marches, major composrtons,
and arrangements that are avaiiable for

bands at many levels. lrecentlyhearda
live performance of Hamson's Dreamby
the U.S. Air  Force Band. Thispiecewon
the prestigious ABtostwald Award in
2002. I  am sure thal  lhere is music on
this disc that will appeal to lisleners and
performers alike. Vvhal a gifl it is to have
so many interesting pieces by lhis major
composer, forboth wind bandand brass
band, on one recording. The program
notes by Ron Holz give complete back-
grcund infomation on lhecomposerand
his music.  This recording should be in
every band lover's library.

Reviewed by Dr. PaulDroste

Firsl ly,  lhe Clncinnat i  Brass Band is lo
be congratulated for its organizational
experlise in presenting, with congenral-
ily, a splendid celebralion in btass. From
anivallo the conclusion of the dazzling
concerl by lhe Brass Band ot Eattle
Creek everylhing was done to make us
comforiable and provide a thoroughly
enjoyable experience.

Secondly, ii is gratifyrng to hear the
improvement in pe rformance level of the
bands. lt seems thal each time I am
privileged to adjudicate, the repertoire,
generally, is more challenging and the
slandard of playing is higher. Yes. there
is still a long way to go before we hear
more than a few top class performances
but is headwarming lhat so many bands
are participating and learning from the
competition experience.

There is no magic. Only by assiduous
prepaGtion and metrculous attentron to
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detail is il possible lo perform al lhe
highest level. The prerequ isites, ofcourse,
are the aitainmenl of good tone (qualily
ofsound) di l igen t  at te nt ion lo dynam cs
(quant i ty of sound);  cognizanceof rhyth-
mrc slructuret and maslery ol the tech-
nical  chal lenges presenled by lhe mu-
sic After these have been mastered,
lhen comes the magic! lt is nolwitten on
lhe pagel lt is the ability to meel the
requirements of the music, recognizing
the various fiioods. Th s is where the
imagination of the conduclor (suppoded
by the talents of the players) convoys
stylewith nuance appropriatepulseand
shading of the musical text. lJnforlu-
nately this cannol be achieved wilhoul
careful atienlion to balance. This was
not always evident in lhe performances
lhat I  heard.

I also want lo poinl oul to the youth
soloists the imporlance of selecting
music thal rs within your technrcai abil-
ity. lt is impossible lo make music if ils
lech n ical challenges are more than can
be comfodably accommodaled. lt is no

coincidence lhat the lop awards in lhe
Youth Solo competilion were given lo
those who selected a composilion rn
wh ch lhey wete close to mastering all
the notes and the manner in which the
notes were connectedl

I greatly admireall bandsand individuals
that competed at NABBA. Your partici
pation is crucial to the feslival of brass
that we were privileged to altend. Con-
gratulalions to those who were honoled
for superior performences. Forthe rcsl,
keep up the good work and remember
theoldadage"when you areaverageyou
are as near to lhe bottom as you are to
lhe lop". Above all, remember lhat
making music is more imporlanl than
winning. Cont inueto supporl  each olher
and exchange ideasand thefutureoithe
brass band movement in North America
wi I  be br ight.

Bramwell L. Gregson



NABBA BOARD NOMINATION FORM

NABBA Board Nominations
Form to Nominate A l/lember of the Board of Directors

(Please Print or Type)

NameofNominee

I Address(Street)

i  
Telephone { )

(Town, State,Zip)

Emall

Note: Nominee must be member in good standing of NABBA

Slatemsnt ot Nomlnee's background and bra$ band etperlence (or attached vita):

| | agree to my name bring placed in nomination for a position as Member-at-Large on the North American Brass Band Associalion,
Inc., Boad of Dhectors. lf elected, l agree to serve at least th ree years, attending asmany NABBAfunctions as lpossiblycan,

i atlending at least one boardmeeting ayear, and will fulfill committee work and other assignments as may be required. lwillhold
. valid membership in NABBA throughout my lhree-year term on the Board.

SignatureofNominee Date

First Nominato/s Signatu.e Pdnted Name

Second Nominator's Sionature PrintedName

Thisform may be duplicated as need6d. Retum the application by August l, 2001 to: Anita Cocker Hunt, NABBA President, 5593
Aulumn Wind Drive, lvlilford OH 45150, marked BOARD NOMINATION FORI\,'l
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BRITISH BRASS BAND MUSIC

Solid Bross Music hos supplied she€t nusic for bross ihstruhents in the U.S. for 16 yeors

qnd hos estoblished on cnvioble reputotion for suPerior sErvice ond Personol ottention.

We now corry shert tnusic frotn these mojor supPli€rs of British Bross Bond music:

Chondos Music

Editions ,[qrc Reift
Gordon /rlusic
(irklees Music

Rosehill Music
R. Stnith & Co.

Visif gur web site or conioct us for o free cotolog.
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SOLID ARASS MUSIC COMPANY

71 ,l t. Roinier Drive, Son Rofoel, CA 94903
(800)873-9798 dick@sldbross.com www.sldbrdss.com

NJH Music of Bamsley, South Yorkshire, publisher of works for brass band by Nigel Hom€ and olhers, is proud to announce lhal
Solid Brass Music Company oI San Rafael, Califomia has agreed to slock th€ir brass band artangements. eflective immedialely
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